OF HUXLEY

TUESDAY — FEBRUARY 13,2018 - HUXLEY CITY HALL
AGENDA

CITY COUNCIL MEETING - 6:00 PM

PUBLIC NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF HUXLEY, IOWA, WILL MEET AT
THE HUXLEY CITY HALL 515 N. MAIN AVE., HUXLEY, JOWA, FOR THEIR REGULAR COUNCIL MEETING AT 6:00 PM

ON TUESDAY THEIITH DAY OF FEBRUARY, 2818 TO DISCUSS THE MATTERS ENUMERATED IN THE AGENDA LISTED
BELOW.

ROLL CALL QUORUM PRESENT

1.00) COMMENTS FROM THE PUBLIC AND RECEIVING OF PETITIONS AND/OR WRITTEN
COMMUNICATIONS TO THE CITY COUNCIL ON AGENDA AND NONAGENDA ITEMS.

2.00) PRESENTATION(S):

BALLARD WEST — Mrs. Nobiling’s 2™ Grade Class
BALLARD CREEK

3.00) PROCLAMATION(S): NONE

4,00) CONSENT AGENDA:

ALL ITEMS LISTED WITHIN THIS SECTION ARE CONSIDERED TQ BE ROUTINE BY THE CITY COUNCIL AND WILL
BE ENACTED BY ONE MOTION. THERE WILL BE NO SEPARATE DISCUSSION OR ACTION ON THESE ITEMS

UNLESS A COUNCIL MEMBER OR CITIZEN SO REQUESTS, IN WHICH EVENT, THE ITEM WILL BE REMQVED
FROM THE GENERAL ORDER OF BUSINESS. AND CONSIDERED SEPARATELY.

4,0i) TO APPROVE THE MINUTES FROM THE FOLLOWING MEETINGS:
January 23, 2018 -- Regular Council Meeting
February 6, 2018 — City Council Worksession

4.02y TO APPROVE FINANCIAL REPORTS AND PAYMENT OF BILLS.
4403) TO APPROVE BEER, WINE AND LIQUOR LICENSES, CIGARETTE PERMITS RENEWALS.

5.00) PUBLIC HEARING(S): NONE

AGENDA ITEMS:
6.00) COMMUNITY BETTERMENT:

6.01 DISCUSSION AND POSSIBLE ACTION ON THIRD READING OF ORDINANCE NO. 467
AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 157 BUILDING CODE, OF THE MUNICIPAL CODE OF
THE CITY OF HUXLEY, IOWA, BY ADOPTING THE 2015 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE
AND 2015 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE WITH AMENDMENTS..

6.02 DISCUSSION AND POSSIBLE ACTION ON THIRD READING OF ORDINANCE NO. 468 AN
ORDINANCE CREATING CHAPTER 158 FIRE CODE, OF THE MUNICIPAL CODE OF THE CITY
OF HUXLEY, IOWA, BY ADOPTING THE 2015 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE WITH
AMENDMENTS.

Page 1




7.00)

8.00)

6.03

6.04

6.05

6.06

6.07

6.08

6.09

6.10

6.11

DISCUSSION AND POSSIBLE ACTION ON THIRD READING OF ORDINANCE NO. 469 AN
ORDINANCE CREATING CHAPTER 159 EXISTING BUILDING CODE, OF THE MUNICIPAL
CODE OF THE CITY OF HUXLEY, IOWA, BY ADOPTING THE 2015 INTERNATIONAL EXISTING
BUILDING CODE WITH AMENDMENTS.

DISCUSSION AND POSSIBLE ACTION ON THIRD READING OF ORDINANCE NOQ, 470 AN
ORDINANCE CREATING CHAPTER 154 PROPERTY MAINTENANCE AND HOUSING CODE, OF
THE MUNICIPAL CODE OF THE CITY OF HUXLEY, IOWA, BY ADOPTING THE 2015
INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE WITH AMENDMENTS.

DISCUSSION AND POSSIBLE ACTION ON THIRD READING OF QRDINANCE NO. 471 AN
ORDINANCE CREATING CHAPTER 161 PLUMBING CODE, OF THE MUNICIPAL CODE OF THE
CITY OF HUXLEY, IOWA, BY ADOPTING THE 2015 INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE WITH
AMENDMENTS.

DISCUSSION AND POSSIBLE ACTION ON THIRD READING OF ORDINANCE NO. 472 AN
ORDINANCE CREATING CHAPTER 162 MECHANICAL CODE, OF THE MUNICIPAL CODE OF
THE CITY OF HUXLEY, IOWA, BY ADOPTING THE 2015 INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL
CODE WITH AMENDMENTS.

DISCUSSION AND POSSIBLE ACTION ON THIRD READING OF ORDINANCE NQ. 473 AN
ORDINANCE CREATING CHAPTER 160 SWIMMING POOL AND SPA CODE, OF THE
MUNICIPAL CODE OF THE CITY OF HUXLEY, IOWA, BY ADOPTING THE 2015
INTERNATIONAL SWIMMING POOL AND SPA CODE WITH AMENDMENTS.

DISCUSSION AND POSSIBLE ACTION ON THIRD READING OF ORDINANCE NQ. 474 AN
ORDINANCE CREATING CHAPTER 164 BUILDING AND PROPERTY REGULATIONS. OF THE
MUNICIPAL CODE OF THE CITY OF HUXLEY, IOWA, BY ADOPTING THE 2017 NATIONAL
ELECTRIC CODE aka NFPA 70.

DISCUSSION AND POSSIBLE ACTION ON THIRD READING OF ORDINANCE NO. 475 AN
ORDINANCE CREATING CHAPTER 163 FUEL GAS CODE, OF THE MUNICIPAL CODE OF THE
CITY OF HUXLEY, [OWA, BY ADOPTING THE 2015 INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE WITH
AMENDMENTS.

DISCUSSION AND POSSIBLE ACTION ON RESOLUTION 18-607 APPROVING SITE PLAN FOR
LOT 3 DEVELOPMENT IN THE HUXLEY BUSINESS PARK.

DISCUSSION AND POSSIBLE ACTION ON RESOLUTION 18-008 APPROVING SITE PLAN FOR
KADING DEVELOPMENT.

PUBLIC SAFETY:

7.01)

7.02)

7.03)

DISCUSSION AND POSSIBLE ACTION ON RESOLUTION 18-009 INTERGOVERNMENTAL 28E
AGREEMENT FOR COMBINED LAW ENFORCEMENT OPERATIONS.

DISCUSSION AND POSSIBLE ACTION ON FIRST READING OF ORDINANCE NQ. 476 AN
ORDINANCE TO ADD 5TOP LIGHTS AS A GENERAL TRAFFIC REGULATION, POSSIBLE WAIVING OF
SECOND AND THIRD READING.

DISCUSSION AND POSSIBLE ACTION ON RESOLUTION 18-010 APPROVING CONTRACT WITH
STORY COUNTY FOR DISPATCHING SERVICES.

FINANCE:

8.01)

DISCUSSION AND POSSIBLE ACTION ON RESOLUTION 18-011 SETTING HEARING ON THE
FY 2019 BUDGET.

Page 2




9.00) LEISURE ACTIVITIES: NONE
10.00) ADMINISTRATIVE BUSINESS:
10.01 DISCUSSION AND POSSIBLE ACTION ON RESOLUTION 18-012 APPROVING HELLAND MINOR
SUBDIVISION FINAL PLAT.
COMMENTS FROM STAFF, COUNCIL AND MAYOR.

ADJOURNMENT

THIS NOTICE 1S HEREBY GIVEN AT LEAST 24 HOURS PRIOR TO THE COMMENCEMENT OF THE MEETING SPECIFIED ABOVE.
THIS WAS DONE BY ADVISING THE NEWS MEDIA WHO HAVE FILED A REQUEST FOR NOTICE AND BY POSTING THE NOTICE ON

THE WINDOW IN THE LOBBY AREA IN CITY HALL THAT IS ACCESSIBLE AND VIEWABLE TO THE PUBLIC. THIS WAS ALL PURSUANT
TO CHAPTER 21 OF THE CODE OF IOWA.

WORKSESSION:

THE CITY COUNCIL WILL MEET FOR AN INFORMAL WORKSESSION TGO WORK ON ITEMS AND NOT TAKE
ANY ACTION ON THOSE FFEMS DURING THE WORKSESSION,

DISCUESION TOPICS;

THAT THE FOLLOWING TOPICS ARE SUGGESTED AND THEY DO NOT REFLECT ALL THE POSSIBLE ITEMS
THAT COULD BE DISCUSEED OR NOT. THE LISTING BELOW DOES NOT NECESSARILY REFLECT THE
ORDER IN WHICH THE 'FEMS WILL BE DISCUSSED OR IF THEY WOULD BE DISCUSSER AT THIS MEETING.

NO ACTION WILL BE TAKEN ON ANY OF THE ITEMS AND THE LIST MAY CHANGE PRIOR TO OR AT THE
MEETING. NO PARTICULAR ORDER AT THIS TIME

Gak Ecnd Road

Part-time Police Officer

CIP Financing

4,  Sidewalk Infill and new

5. Development agrecinents

&, Main Street Bevelopment

7. Maintenance Bond for Developments

8. Installing Ped Ramps

9. Granular Subbase #nd subdrains under pavement
10, Miscelianeous

ol I mma
PR

THIS NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN AT LEAST 24 HOURS PRIOR TO THE COMMENCEMENT OF THE MEETING SPECIFIED ABOVE.

THIS WAS DONE BY ADVISING THE NEWS MEDIA WHO HAVE FILED 4 REQUEST FOR NOTICE AND BY POSTING THE NOTICE ON
THE WINDOW IN THE LOBBY AREA IN CITY HALL THAT IS ACCESSIBLE AND VIEWABLE TO THE PUBLIC. THIS WAS ALL PURSUANT
TOYWHAPTER 21 OF THE CODE OF IOWA.

Page 3




DEPARTMENT
REPORT AND
COMMUNICATIONS



January 24, 2018

Ms. Jolene Lettow

Finance Director/City Cierk
City of Huxley

515 N. Main Ave.

Huxley, lowa 50124

Re: Director of the Huxley Public Library

Ms. Lettow:

Ms. Cathy Van Maanen accepted the offer from the Board of Trustees at the
Board meeting last night and is now the Director of the Huxley Public Library. The

Board set her annual salary at $44,000. She will continue to be a full time
employee.

Thank you in advance for making the necessary changes.

Thomas J. Friedriclisen

Secretary
Board of Trustees of the Huxley Public Library




City of Huxley
Huxley Police Department
Monthly Report
January 2018

1/1/2018 9:45 AM Officer transported a juvenile female from the 200 block of Oak Blvd to
Rosedale in Ames for a parental placement.

1/2/2018 5:45 PM Officer responded to a car vs. deer accident on Highway 69 near 310" Lane.
A vehicle operated by an Ankeny woman struck a deer causing minimal damage.

1/2/2018 10:30 PM Officer responded to a single vehicle accident on interstate 35 near the
104 Mile Marker. A vehicle operated by a West Des Moines man slid off the road and into the
ditch. No injuries.

1/4/2018 3:35 PM Officer cited a 55 year old Huxley woman for Violation of a School Bus Stop
Arm on Oak Blvd near Hickory.

1/4/2018 4:24 PM Officer received a harassment complaint at the 500 block of E 4*". Contact
was made with a 42 year old Huxley man who agreed to stop the harassing behavior in order to
avoid future police attention.

1/6/2018 8:00 AM Officer received a complaint of a set of mailboxes that had been damaged.
It was learned that a Huxley juvenile had slid into the boxes and arrangements were made for .
him to fix the post the mailboxes set upon.

1/6/2018 2:21 PM Officer responded to a single vehicle accident on North 5™ Ave near
Lynwood. A vehicle operated by a 30 year old Slater man slid off the road and struck an
electrical box. Minimal damage to both the box and vehicle. No injuries.

1/8/2018 7:57 AM Officer responded to the 600 block of E 1% for a two vehicle accident. A
vehicle operated by a Cambridge juvenile rear ended a vehicle operated by another Cambridge
female causing approximately $6000 total damage. No injuries.

1/10/2018 7:55 AM Officer cited a juvenile Ballard Student with Possession of a vaping
product at the Ballard High School parking lot.

1/12/2018 9:05 AM Officer responded to Highway 69 and Oak for a two vehicle accident. A
vehicle operated by a Huxley juvenile rear ended a vehicle operated by a Huxley man causing
approximately $1500 in damage. No injuries.

1/16/2018 4:45 PM Officer received a theft report at the 700 block of Maple. A Huxley family
had Amazon packages stolen after delivery.



1/18/2018 6:30 PM Officer responded to a car vs. deer accident at the 1200 block of E 1% St. A
vehicle operated by a Cambridge woman struck a deer causing minimal damage.

1/22/2018 10:30 AM Officer received a dog bite complaint at the 800 block of Ashwood. A
Fed Ex delivery employee was bitten on the thigh.

1/22/2018 6:47 PM Officer responded to a domestic altercation at the 100 block of Oak Blvd.
A 42 year old Huxley man was arrested for Domestic Assault and transported to the Story
County Jail in Nevada.

1/25/2018 2:53 AM Officer stopped a vehicle for a traffic violation on Highway 69 near
Highway 210. A 23 year old Ames man was arrested for a warrant. He was also charged with
Providing False Information.

Huxley Officers had two arrests for the month. One was for Domestic Assault and the other for
a warrant served. Officers issued ten citations for traffic offenses and gave sixty one warnings.
Officers received 135 calls for service or information and had a total of 349 contacts for the
month. Officers used 223 hours toward investigations, answering calls for service, or providing
assistance and gave 386.5 hours of general patrol.

Mark Pore’ )p

élie lic ~



(44}

[=]

529

SL°ST9

SINOH [e10

SLE

[=3

SLE

88€

u
—

5'98¢

CHs / 1oned|

S°€ZL

N
0
~

SL'8TE

J3y10 / 0o]

J1e3-ug|

50T
(143

50T
(743

suonedisaay|

s]pejuo) 1ol

y1eaq papuaneun

Uayl

ssedsal)

JUAPIODY ayJel ]|

{1e2 24l

aayap dsns

uoslad 'dsng

JaauQ pauseg/aay/dsns

25NqYy Xa5]

uosiad m:_mm__z_

Hio|lo|o|N|F|OIM|O|M(O|O

Lad E=1 E=11=1 121 = -1 T =1 A =3 =)

waijed jejuan|

SET

SET

183 “oju)

juaLussRIRH

ansawog

Janpue) Aaplosig

eyeussydesed 8niq

02dq]

JRUPSIA [BUIWLY

andsig 1A

35NqV PIYD)

QI |N|O|=]l- |0

DO|FIN|Oi-|[—|w|wn

Aejging

m
L

1SHOI0[A Isissy

0
r~

0)/palN/auld 1sissy

s)nessy

112 |ewWiuy

IMO-10403]Y

X0 "gnd-|0Yodfy

UOISS3SS04-|0YOI[Y

Jauleluo) usd-joyoaly|

uondwinsuo) -joyodpy

0" -|oyodfy,

s12011 Buppeq

sBuLuIEM JLJel ]|

suopel oyel]|

ojlojo|oc|o|jo|c|jo|ojo|o|o|o|o|o|o|jo|o|jojo|jo|o|e|o|o|o|ojo|o|o|o|o|o|o|o|o| offolo|o|ela] o

(=] [=1[=]1g=3d=] k=] 1=] =] J=] i=] [=] [=] [=] =] §=] [=] =] [=] } =] E=] E=] F=] [=] [=] [=] [=] [=] =} [=) P F=1 1 I ST 2 ) I R =0 =)

o|Q[oIo|o|o|ojo|o|o[o|o|o|o|o|o|ojo|ojolo|o|ojo|o|o|o|o|a|o|a|o|o|o|c|lo| oRolo|lo|o|o] ©

olojojo|o|o|o|o|a|ojo||o|o|olo|o|ojo|o|ojo|o|o|olojo|o|o|o|olo|olale|ol ofoloio|o|ol o

o|Qje|o|c|o|o|o|o|jo|o|ojo|olo|ofo|ojo|lo|o|o|oja|o|alofololo|o|oolo|olo| ofo|o|ofole] ©

FEEEEEEEEEEE EEEEEEEEEEEEEEEEEEEEEEREEE B R

[=11=] =] =]0=]=]0=] =] =] }=] [=] [=] §=] k=] =] I =] k=] [=] [=] [=] I=] I=] F=) IS = = =) = E B 1 E EBE EFE E EE OOGDQO

cfo|o|olo[ololo|e[ololelcle|ac(o|olelo[o|a|olc|elo|o|olololofolo|olc|lclolololalolalol o

[=11=] [=1 =] I=]£=] [=] [=] [=] =] =] E=] B =] [=] =] 0= B E E N = = = S I EIE E R R E R R EERE BEREEREEE

EEIEEEEEEEEEEEEEE P EE EEEADEEEIE AR E DD DR E B EREIEE

HEEEEEEEEEEEEEEE EEE AR EEEEDEER RN RN EAE AR

S)SRLIY|

21280138y Ajieay,

Jaguzag

JagquiaaoN

lagoiQ

Rqundag

1sndny

Ajnp

aunr

Aepy

udy

yuep

Adeniqay

fenuef

23832138y AjyIuoi

Aapny



CONSENT AGENDA



Huxley City Council Minutes
Tuesday, January 23, 2018

These minutes are as recorded by the City Clerk and are subject to City Council approval at the next regular
council meeting.

COUNCIL MEETING: The Huxley City Council met in a regular council meeting on the above date pursuant to rules
of the council, notice posted at City Hall, posted on website and emailed to news media. Mayor Henry called the
meeting to order at 6:00 pm.

COUNCIL MEMBERS PRESENT: Peterson, Roberts, Kuhn, Mulder, Jensen — via conference call

CITY STAFF PRESENT: John Haldeman-City Administrator, Jolene Lettow-City Clerk, Mark Pote — Police Chief, Jeff
Peterson — Public Works Director, Chad Anthony — Fire Chief

CONSULTANTS PRESENT: Forrest Aldrich, city engineer

GUESTS PRESENT: Krista McGuinn, Kevin Deaton, Brittany and Zachary Swanson, Nels Nord, Henry Rumbaugh,
David and Verda Tesdall, Julee and Troy Petersen, Stacia Wilson, Dean Lande, Melissa Wnuk, Andrew Gogerty,
Britt Gage, Tiffany Gross, Emily Lutter, Tracy Lindquist, Joe Schierbrock, Dan Novelli, Ron Edwards, Kristi Swanson

CONSENT AGENDA:
MOTION- Kuhn, Second — Mulder to approve all agenda items as listed.
e Approve January 9th and January 16th, 2018 Council Meeting Minutes

¢ Approve Financial Reports and Payment of Bills

Councilman Kuhn noted that minutes from January 9t" meeting needed a correction with number listed for
Ordinance #466. Roll Call: Kuhn, Jensen, Peterson, Roberts, Mulder voted yes. Motion carried.

Claims:

2ND WIND EXERCISE WEIGHT ROOM CARDIC EQUTPMENT 33,162.75
A TECH-TCI 1/1/18-3/31/18 FIRE ALARM MONI 105.00
ANKENY SANITATION WWTP 220.73
ARNOLD MOTOR SUFPFPLY OIL, ATIR, AND FUEL FILTERS & W 170.69
AUTOHATIC SYSTEMS CO. 240 VAC PHASE MONITOR 695.60
CARDMEMBER SERVICE SEE ATTACHED 731.76
CASEY'S GENERAL STORES INC GASOLINE 1,414.87
CENTRAL IOWA TELEVISING SANITARY SEWER CLEANING 4,127.50
CENTRAL PUMP & MOTOR, LLC REPAIR & INSTALL OF FLYGT PUMP 3,268.09
CONSUMERS ENERGY GAS AND ELECTRIC 10,914.31
DB IOWA HOLDINGS LEGAL PUBLICATIONS 846.59
DOLLAR GENERAL CORPORATICN PROGRAM SUPPLIES 119.50
G & L CLOTHING CLOTHING ALLOWANCE-KELTH 896.03
GALL'S, LLC TACTICAL/MEDICAL BACKPACKS 155.97
HACH COMPANY RETURN SENSOR CAP 1,219.58
HALLETT MATERIALS ICE CONTROL SAND 198.66
HOKEL MACHINE SUPPLY CHATN, CAP LINKS, ARGON TANK 64.44
HUNTER TOMS YOUTH BASKETBALL OFFICIAL 90.00
HUXLEY COOP TELEPHONE CO. CABLE, INTERNET, PHONE 1,852.10
INTERNAL REVENUE SERVICE FED WITHOLDING TaxX 16,284.03
INTERSTATE BATTERIES ECONO BATTERIES 110.00
IOWA DOT SNOW SHOVELS 40.98
IPERS IPERS 6,617.76
JACQUE GLOEDE MILEAGE RETMBURSE FOR ACADEMY 72.76
JAYDEN CATTELL YOUTH BBALL REFEREE/TIME CLOCK 90.00
JEREMY J. ARENDS DECEMBER TREASURERS REPORT 160.00
KEYSTONE LABORATORIES WW SAMPLING 174.80
M. R. FROPERTIES LC M. R. PROPERTIES LC 195,800.55
MzRCO, INC. PD COFPIER CONTRACT 412.72
MARTIN MARIETTA MATERIALS ROAD STONE & AG LIME 356.60
MARY GREELEY MEDICRL CENTE MEDICAL SUPPLIES G.o00



MISCELLANECUS VENDOR
MUNICTPAL SUPPLY

TURNER, GRANT :US REFUND
MLCRO COUPLERS & FPIFE

604.
920.

NAPA AUTO PARTS BULBS 224.38
NEW CENTURY FS INC UNLEADED ~AND DIESEL FUEL 1,126.23
OXEN TECHNOLOGY MONTHLY MICROSOFT EXCHANGE 444 .00
PEPSI-COLA CASEYS OF POP FOR VENDING 303.05
PLUMB SUPPLY COMPANY AM URINAL PARTS 155.78
POSTMASTER POSTMASTER 336.45
SAFE BUILDING COMPLIANCE & BUTLDING INSPECTICNS 20,424.64
STORY COUNTY SHERIFF'S OFF 3RD QUARTER DISPATCH FEE 5,957.00
TASC FLEX BENEFIT PLANS 574.96
TERENCE MILLER YOUTH BASKETBALL QFFICIAL 170.00
TIM VANLCO YOUTH BASKETBALL OFFICIAL 60.00

TREASURER, STATE QF IOQWA STATE WITHHOLDING 1,950.00

VAN-WALL EQUIPMENT INC. NEW LAWN MOWER 10,500.00
VEENSTRA & KIMM, INC. 550TH AVENUE - GENERAL ENGINEE 8,800.00
VERIZON WIRELESS AMBULANCE CELL PHONES 434.53
001 GENERAL FUND 54,719.24
0c2 LIBRARY 1,763.34
003 RECREATION 36,456.86
004 FIRE AND RESCUE 483.69
014 ALBULANCE 1,352.69
110 STREET 7,239.57
321 DEVELOPMENT LOANS 195,800.55
600 WATER UTILITY 10,683.62
610 SEWER UTILITY 19,568.22
PAYROLL 44,861.52
GRAND TOTAL 372,929.30

PUBLIC HEARING: Mayor opened meeting at 6:03pm. There were no comments received from the public.
MOTION - Kuhn, Second Peterson to close hearing at 6:04pm. 4 ayes, 1 abstain — David Jensen.

MOTION — Mulder, Second - Roberts on Third Reading of Ordinance No. 466 Amending Various Code Sections:
Section 55.16, Section 69.09, Chapter 140 of the Huxley Municipal Code. There were comments received from
citizens regarding the pit bull ordinance. Roll Call: Kuhn, Roberts, Peterson, Mulder voted yes; Jensen voted no.
Motion carried.

MOTION - Roberts, Second — Kuhn on Second Readings of Ordinances 467 to 475, excluding Ordinance 468, to
Update and Comply with 2015 Building Codes — an update from 2008 Building Code. Roll Call: Kuhn, Roberts,
Peterson, Jensen, Mulder voted yes. Motion carried.

MOTION - Roberts, Second — Mulder on Second Reading of Ordinance 468, an Ordinance Creating Chapter 158
Fire Code of the Municipal Code of the City of Huxley, lowa by Adopting the 2015 International Fire Code with
Amendments. It was discussed that Sections 1103.7.6 and 1103.8 of Fire Code have an effective date of January
1, 2020. Rol! Call: Kuhr, Roberts, Peterson, Mulder voted yes; Jensen voted no. Motion carried.

MOTION - Roberts, Second — Mulder on Resolution No. 18-002 — a Corrective Resolution Reauthorizing
Disposition of Property. Roll Call: Roberts, Kuhn, Peterson, Mulder voted yes; Jensen abstained.

MOTION — Peterson, Second- Roberts on Resolution No. 18-003 to Authorize Solicitation for RFP’s for Capital
Improvement Plan. Roll Call: Kuhn, Peterson, Roberts, Mulder voted yes; Jensen voted no. Motion carried.

MOTION — Peterson, Second- Roberts on Resolution No. 18-004 to Set Date for Public Hearing on Urban Renewal
Plan Amendment. Topic to be placed on work session agenda for February 16 meeting with public hearing date
scheduled for February 27. Roll Call: Kuhn, Peterson, Roberts, Mulder voted yes; Jensen voted no. Motion

carried.

MOTION — Kuhn, Second — Mulder on Resolution No. 18-005 to Authorize Submission of Grant Proposal for Heart
of lowa Trail Paving Project. Roll Call: Mulder, Kuhn, Jensen, Peterson, Roberts voted yes. Motion carried.



MOTION — Kuhn, Second — Roberts on Resolution No. 18-006 to Authorize Submission of a Grant Proposal for the
East 1st Street Rehabilitation Project. Roll Call: Roberts, Mulder, Kuhn, Jensen, Peterson voted yes. Motion

carried.

Miscellaneous
- Fire Chief, Chad Anthony, requested a Knox Box be placed outside of 3C’s building to allow access to building

in case of emergency.
-  City engineer, Forrest Aldrich, informed council that construction on 550™ Street was being monitored to

maintain safety.
Counciiman Mulder congratulated city administrator on appointment to Vice-Chair for CIRPTA committee.
Councilman Kuhn asked council to email him with any questions regarding new building code.

- Councilman Jensen suggested there be a work session scheduled to discuss Capital Inprovement Plan. He also
thanked city engineer and public works director for the work to keep 550 Street safe during construction,

- Mayor thanked councilman Kuhn for all his efforts to bring city’s building codes up-to-date.

ADJOURNMENT: Motion —Roberts, second ~ Peterson to adjourn meeting at 7:53pm. 5 ayes, 0 nays.

Craig D. Henry, Mayor
Attest:

Jolene R. Lettow, City Clerk



Huxley City Council Minutes
Tuesday, February 6, 2018

These minutes are as recorded by the City Clerk and are subject to City Council approval at the next regular
council meeting.

COUNCIL MEETING: The Huxley City Council met in a work session on the above date pursuant to rules of the
council, notice posted at City Hall, posted on website and emailed to news media. Mayor Henry called the

meeting to order at 5:32 pm.

COUNCIL MEMBERS PRESENT: Peterson, Roberts, Kuhn, Mulder, Jensen

CITY STAFF PRESENT: John Haldeman-City Administrator, Jolene Lettow-City Clerk
WORK SESSION: Mayor opened meeting at 5:32 pm.

Council met to discuss the proposed fiscal year 2019 budget. Public hearing will be scheduled for February 27th.

Miscellaneous
Councilman Kuhn provided information regarding State mandated fire code changes and provided detailed

information on swimming pool regulations.

ADJOURNMENT: Motion —Peterson, second — Jensen to adjourn meeting at 7:08pm. 5 ayes, 0 nays.

Craig D. Henry, Mayor
Attest:

Jolene R. Lettow, City Clerk



2-13-18 Council Claims List

A B C

1 [VENDOR NAME DESCRIPTION GROSS AMOUNT
2 |AaFLac AFLAC 5 4.00
3 |ALLIANT ENERGY GAS AND ELECTRIC $ 14,011.93
4 |AMERICAN PLANNING ASSOCIAT APA MEMBERSHIP 5 444.00

WWTP, 3C'S, NORD KALSEM, MAINT.
5 |ANKENY SANITATION SHOP TRASH PICKUP $ 220.73
6 |ARNOLD MOTOR SUPPLY FUEL FILTER, WINDSHIELD WASHERTIP | $ 48.80
7 |BAKER GROUP WWTP MECHANICAL ROOM REPAIR $ 7,055.75
8 |BALLARD HEATING & COOLING REPAIR FURNACE IN OLD WATERPLA 3 78.00
9 |BOUND TREE MEDICAL MEDICAL SUPPLIES 5 71.43
10 |BRICK GENTRY P.C. LEGAL FEES $ 3,393.75
11 |BUD'S AUTO REPAIR INC DODGE BRAKES AND ROTORS $ 1,676.21
12 |CARPENTER UNIFORM CO. UNIFORM FOR SEAN EVANS $ 199.98
13 |CASEY'S GENERAL STORES INC GASOLINE $ 1,288.01
14 |CENTERPOINT LARGE PRINT SUBSCRIPTIION FOR WESTERNS $ 42.54
15 |CENTRAL IOWA DISTRIBUTING JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR WWTP $ 143.00
16 |CHITTY GARBAGE SERVICE INC FD TRASH PICKUP $ 43.34
17 |CINTAS CORPORATION FIRST AID SUPPLIES $ 67.77
18 [COMPASS BUSINESS SOLUTIONS COARSE BULK SALT g 3,192.24
19 |DELTA DENTAL PLAN OF IOWA DENTAL INSURANCE $ 1,884.42
20 |DOORS INC. REPAIR DOOR AT WWTP $ 325.00
21 |EBS MEDICAL INSURANCE $ 15,389.28
22 |EDWARD IONES | IrA $ 250.00
23 |[ENERGY DOCTOR LED BULBS s 1,607.00
24 |FIDELITY SECURITY LIFE VISION INS $ 306.62
25 |G & L CLOTHING JEANS FOR JEFF $ 26.99
26 [HACH COMPANY BOD STANDARD SOLUTION $ 603.05
27 |HALVORSON TRANE WORK ON OUTSIDE LIGHTS AT 3C'S $ 571.89
28 |HAWKINS, INC. CHEMICALS FOR WATER TREATMENT $ 2,239.89

CYLINDER RENTAL & FIRE EXTINGUISHER
29 |HOKEL MACHINE SUPPLY INSPECTIONS $ 536.91
30 |HOWE'S WELDING/METAL FAB HOT ROLLED ROD FOR CURB RUNNER 3 156.44
31 |[HUNTER TOMS YOUTH BBALL OFFICIAL $ 20.00
32 |HUXLEY COOP TELEPHONE CO. INTERNET, CABLE, PHONES $ 1,832.10
33 |INTEGRATED PRINT SOLUTIONS YOUTH BASKETBALL JERSEYS $ 783.00
34 |INTERNAL REVENUE SERVICE PAYROLL TAXES $ 9,291.17
35 [JOWA DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 10% OF FORFEITED FUNDS $ 40.31

PLOW BOLTS & NUTS, FLAT STEEL,
36 |IOWA DOT TISSUE, PAPER TOWELS $ 521.26
37 |IOWA FIREFIGHTER'S ASSOCIA MEMBERSHIP DUES $ 354.00
38 [toWA MUNICIPAL FINANCE OFF 2018-2019 MEMBERSHIP DUES $ 50.00
39 [IOWA ONE CALL LOCATE EMAILS $ 124.20
40 [IPERS IPERS $ 12,649.47
41 |JACQUE GLOEDE UNIFORM & TRAVEL REIMBURSEMENT | $ 364.86
42 |JAYDEN CATTELL YOUTH BBALL REF/TIMER $ 140.00




2-13-18 Council Claims List

A B C
43 |KEMPKER'S TRUE VALUE SEE ATTACHED $ 715.25
44 |KEYSTONE LABORATORIES MONTHLY WATER SAMPLING S 137.70
45 [LINCOLN FINANCIAL GROUP LIFE & DISABILITY INSURANCE S 990.78
| 46 |MARCO, INC. ADMIN COPIER MAINT AGREEMENT $ 397.36
47 |MARCO, INC. FD COPIER MAINT. AGREEMENT S 211.55
48 |MARTIN MARIETTA MATERIALS CLEAN ROCK $ 267.44
49 |MASS MUTUAL RETIREMENT SER DEFERRED COMPENSATION S 250.00
50 |MAT KAHLER APPLICATOR TESTS REIMBURSED S 60.00
51 |MISCELLANEOUS VENDORS UTILITY DEPOSIT REFUNDS S 604.21
52 |MIDWEST ALARM SERVICES SERVICE CALL AT 3C'S S 337.20
53 |NICKOLAY CONSULTING, LLC MONTHLY IT SUPPORT/MAINT $ 105.00 |
54 |NOVA FITNESS EQUIPMENT SERVICE CALL FOR TREADMILLS 5 89.00
55 |O'REILLY AUTOMOTIVE, INC. SPARK PLUGS, LIGHT, REGULATOR 5 106.00
56 |OXEN TECHNOLOGY MONTHLY MICROSOFT EXCHANGE FEE | § 148.00
57 |PCC AN AMBULANCE BILLING S AUGUST BILLING $ 763.70
58 |PEPSI-COLA POP FOR VENDING $ 433.01
59 |PESTICIDE BUREAU APPLICATOR LICENSE-KAHLER S 15.00
60 |PRAXXO SCREENING/GRIT BAG $ 145.47
61 |QUALITYONE COMMERCIAL CLEA CLEANING SERVICE FOR FEBRUARY S 2,134.00
62 |RELIASTAR LIFE INSURANCE C LIFE INSURANCE $ 374.22
63 |SAFE BUILDING COMPLIANCE & CITY CODE INSPECTIONS S 17,073.96
64 |SCOTT HERMANN YOUTH BASKETBALL REFEREE $ 40.00
65 |SPRINGER PROFESSIONAL HOME FD MONTHLY TREATMENT $ 42.00
66 |STAPLES BUSINESS CREDIT OFFICES SUPPLIES $ 407.86
67 |STORY COUNTY FIREFIGHTERS ANNUAL DUES S 50.00
68 |TASC FLEX BENEFIT PLANS $ 574.96
69 |TASC - CLIENT INVOICES MARCH FLEX ADMIN FEE 5 67.91
1 70 |TERENCE MILLER YOUTH BBALL OFFICIAL 5 250.00
71 {TIM VANLOO YOUTH BBALL LEAGUE OFFICIAL S 80.00
72 | TREASURER, STATE OF IOWA STATE WITHHOLDING $ 3,355.00
73 |TRI COUNTY TIMES ANNUAL SUBSCRIPTION $ 46.00
74 [TYLER MORTVEDT DJ FOR FATHER/DAUGHTER DANCE S 150.00
75 |U.S. BANK EQUIPMENT FINANC MONTHLY LEASE FOR COPIER S 99.00
MUFFLER & CUTTING EDGE FOR SNOW
76 |VAN-WALL EQUIPMENT INC. BLOWER S 136.10
77 |VEENSTRA & KIMM, INC. ENGINEERING FEES S 8,589.00
| 78 |VERIZON WIRELESS ADMIN CELL PHONE $ 44.76
79 |VISA SEE ATTACHED $ 797.31
80 |WEF MEMBERSHIP 2018 MEMBERSHIP $ 95.00
81 [WINDSTREAM IOWA COMMUNICAT PD PHONE AT DISPATCH S 71.03
82 |Payroli Expense S 43,467.87
83 |GRAND TOTAL $ 165,771.99
84
85

86




2-13-18 Council Claims List

A B
87 FUND TOTALS
88 [001 GENERAL FUND S 66,120.25
89 |002 LIBRARY S 5,429.78
90 |003 RECREATION S 7,135.40
91 |004 FIRE AND RESCUE $ 2,792.21
92 (014 AMBULANCE $ 2,840.98
93 [100 PRAIRIE RIDGE DEVELOPMENT S 275.00
94 [110 ROAD USE TAX S 11,370.82
95 |600 WATER UTILITY S 16,050.51
96 |610 SEWER UTILITY $ 10,289.17
97 |01 PAYROLL EXPENSE S 43,467.87
98 |GRAND TOTAL S 165,771.99




KEMPKER'S TRUE VALUE BREAK DOWN

Parks S 26.95 |eye bolt, builders hardware,

Nord Kalsem S 22.99 |light bulbs,

Grounds S 65.18 |snowplow, wire connector
repair mender, hitch pin, tubing cutter, furnace filter,

Water S 98.49 |plumbing and heating, vulkem blac,
insullation kit, masking tape, hydraulic hose & fittings, heat
shrink tube, key, drill bit, paint, couplings, plugs, light

Streets S 254.33 |bulbs, nuts and bolts, cable clamps, cut wheel
antifreeze, windshield washer fluid, key, power strip,
heater prong, extension cord, builders hardware, shovel,

Wastewater S 223.08 |hose for samplers

FD S 24.23 |forstner bit tubed, builders hardware

Total S 715.25

VISA BREAK DOWN

Admin $485.31 |passport envelopes, printer ink, passport paper, postage

PD $225.00 |winter uniform for gloede

FD $30.00 |background checks

Library $57.00 |postage

Total $797.31




Applicant License Application ( )

Name of Applicant:  claudia longoria

Name of Business (DBA): victor's mexican restaurant
Address of Premises: 802 n highway 68

City Huxley County: Story Zip: 50124
Business 15) 597-4639

Mailing 400 hackley ave

City desmoines State A Zip: 20315

Contact Person

Name claudia longoria

Phone: (515) 867-8020 Email victarsmexicanrestaurant@gmail.com
Classification Class C Liguor License (LC) (Commercial)

Term:§ months
Effective Date: 01/30/2018
Expiration Date: 01/01/1900

Privileges:

Class C Liquor License ({LC) (Commercial)

Status of Business

BusinessType: Sole Proprietorship
Corporate [D Number:  X3OOKXXXX Federal Employer ID 20000KKXXX

Ownership

claudia longoria

First Name: claudia Last Name:  [ongotria

City: State: lowa Zip: 50315
Position: owner

% of Ownership: 100.00% U.S. Citizen: Yes

Insurance Company Information

Insurance Company: General Insurance Company of America

Policy Effective Date: Policy Expiration
Bond Effective Dram Cancel Date:
Outdoor Service Effective Outdoor Service Expiration

Temp Transfer Effective Temp Transfer Expiration Date:




Applicant License Application ( BC0029860 )

Name of Applicant: DOLGENCORP 1LiC

Name of Business (DBA): Dollar General Store # 812
Address of Premises: 614 N US HIGHWAY 69

Business (515) 597-2444
Mailing 100 Mission Ridge

City Goodiettsville State TN Zip:

City Huxley County: Story Zip:

37072

Contact Person

Name Katie Durham

Phone: (615) 855-4000 Email tax-beerandwinelicense@dollargeneral.com

Classification Class C Beer Permit (BC)
Term:12 months

Effective Date: 03/01/2018

Expiration Date: 02/28/2019
Privileges:
Class B Wine Permit
Class C Beer Permit (BC

Sunday Sales

Status of Business

BusinessType: Limited Liability Company
Corporate ID Number:  XXXXXXXXX Federal Employer D JOOOXXXXXX

Ownership
Dollar General Corporation
First Name: Dollar Last Name: General Corporation

City: Goodlettsville State: Tennesses Zip:

Position: NiA

% of Ownership: 100.00% U.S. Citizen: Yes
Lawrence Gatta

First Name: Lawrence Last Name:  Gafia

City: Brentwood State: Tennessee Zip:

Position: n-Member Manager

% of Ownership: 0.00% U.S. Citizen: Yes
James Thorpe

First Name: James Last Name: Thorpe

City: Gallatin State: Tennessee Zip:

37027

37066




COMMUNITY
BETTERMENT



Prepared by Dave Kuhn, Council, and reformatted by John Haldeman, City Administrator for the Huxley City Council
meeting to be held on the 9th day of January, 2018.

ORDINANCE NO. 467

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 157 BUILDING CODE, OF THE MUNICIPAL
CODE OF THE CITY OF HUXLEY, IOWA, BY ADOPTING THE 2015 INTERNATIONAL
BUILDING CODE AND 2015 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE WITH
AMENDMENTS

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Huxley, Iowa desires to continue to protect life, safety
and property through the adoption and enforcement of construction codes, and to establish the minimum
requirements to safeguard the public health, safety and general welfare through structural strength, means
of egress facilities, stability, sanitation, adequate light and ventilation, energy conservation, and safety to
life and property from fire and other hazards attributed to the built environment and to provide safety to fire
fighters and emergency responders during emergency operations;

WHEREAS, the Council now deems it appropriate to revise the Municipal Code by adopting the
latest addition of the International Code Council Building Code and Residential Code.

. NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
HUXLEY, IOWA: *

1. That Chapter 157 of the Municipal Code of the City of Huxley, Iowa, the Building Regulations be
repealed and there be enacted in lieu thereof the following Chapter;

CHAPTER 157 BUILDING CODE

157.01 SHORT TITLE. This chapter shall be known as the Huxley Building Code, and may be cited as
such, and may be referred to herein as this chapter

157.02 ADOPTION OF BUILDING CODE. Pursuant to published notice as required by law, the
International Building Code 2015 Edition; and the International Residential Building Code 2015 Edition,
published by the International Code Council, Inc., is adopted in full except for such portions as may be
hereinafter deleted, modified or amended. A copy of the International Building Code 2015 Edition as
adopted, a copy of the International Residential Code 2015 Edition as adopted and a copy of this chapter
are on file in the office of the Code Official. '

157.03 AMENDMENTS, MODIFICATIONS, ADDITIONS AND DELETIONS. The International
Building Code, 2015 Edition (hereinafter known as the IBC), and the Infernational Residential Code, 2015
Edition (hereinafter known as the IRC), are amended as hereinafter set out in Sections 157.04 through
157.46.

157.04 REFERENCED CODES - - CONFLICTS. The remaining sections in this chapter represent
amendments to the requirements contained in the IBC and IRC. In the event requirements of this code

HUXLEY BUILDING CODE 1



Prepared by Dave Kuhn, Council, and reformatted by John Haldeman, City Administrator for the Huxley City Council
meeting to be held on the 9th day of Jannary, 2018.

ORDINANCE NO. 468

AN ORDINANCE CREATING CHAPTER 158 FIRE CODE, OF THE MUNICIPAL CODE OF
THE CITY OF HUXLEY, IOWA, BY ADOPTING THE 2015 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
WITH AMENDMENTS

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Huxley, lowa desires to continue to protect life, safety
and property through the adoption and enforcement of construction codes, and to establish the minimum
requirements consistent with nationally recognized good practice for providing a reasonable level of life
safety and property protection from the hazards of fire, explosion or dangerous conditions in new and
existing buildings, structures and premises and to provide safety to fire fighters and emergency responders
during emergency operations;

WHEREAS, the Council now deems it appropriate to revise the Municipal Code by adopting the
latest edition of the International Code Council Fire Code.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
HUXLEY, IOWA:

1. That Chapter 158 of the Municipal Code of the City of Huxley, Iowa, the Public Improvements be
renumbered to Chapter 155 in Municipal Code of the City of Huxley, Iowa.

2. That Chapter 158 of the Municipal Code of the City of Huxley, Iowa, the Fire Regulations be
created and there be enacted in lieu thereof the following Chapter;

158.01 SHORT TITLE. This chapter shall be known as the Huxley Firc Code, and may be cited as such,
and may be referred to herein as this chapter

158.02 ADOPTION OF FIRE CODE. The International Fire Code 2015 Edition, published by the
International Code Council, Inc., is adopted in full except for such portions as may be hereinafter deleted,
modified or amended. A copy of the International Fire Code 2015 Edition, as adopted, and a copy of this
chapter are on file in the office of the Code Official.

158.03 AMENDMENTS, MODIFICATIONS, ADDITIONS AND DELETIONS. The Infernational
Fire Code, 2015 Edition (hereinafter known as the IFC), is amended as hereinafter set out in Sections
158.04 through 158.25.

158.04 REFERENCED CODES - - CONFLICTS. The remaining sections in this chapter represent
amendments to the requirements contained in the IFC. In the event requirements of this code conflict with

applicable State and/or Federal requirements, the more stringent shall apply.

158.05 SECTION 101.1 AMENDED - - TITLE. Section 101.1, Title, of the IFC, is hereby deleted and
there is enacted in lieu thereof the following section:

Section 101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Huxley Fire Code, hereinafter known as “this
code.”

HUXLEY FIRE CODE ;



Prepared by Dave Kuhn, Council, and reformatted by John Haldeman, City Administrator for the Huxley City Council
meeting to be held on the 9th day of January, 2018.

ORDINANCE NO. 469

AN ORDINANCE CREATING CHAPTER 159 EXISTING BUILDING CODE, OF THE
MUNICIPAL CODE OF THE CITY OF HUXLEY, IOWA, BY ADOPTING THE 2015
INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING CODE WITH AMENDMENTS

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Huxley, Iowa desires to continue to protect life, safety
and property including existing buildings through the adoption and enforcement of construction codes, and
to establish the minimum requirements to safeguard the public health, safety and general welfare through
structural strength, means of egress facilities, stability, sanitation, adequate light and ventilation, energy
conservation, and safety to life and property from fire and other hazards attributed to the built environment
and to provide safety to fire fighters and emergency responders during emergency operations;

WHEREAS, the Council now deems it appropriate to revise the Municipal Code by adopting the
latest edition of the International Code Council Existing Building Code.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
HUXLEY, IOWA:

1. That Chapter 159 of the Municipal Code of the City of Huxley, lowa, the Existing Building Regulations
be enacted in the following Chapter;

159.01 SHORT TITLE. This chapter shall be known as the Huxley Existing Building Code, and may be
cited as such, and may be referred to herein as this chapter

159.02 ADOPTION OF EXISTING BUILDING CODE. The International Existing Building Code 2015
Edition; published by the International Code Council, Inc., is adopted in full except for such portions as
may be hereinafter deleted, modified or amended. A copy of the International Existing Building Code 2015
Edition, as adopted and a copy of this chapter are on file in the office of the Code Official.

159.03 AMENDMENTS, MODIFICATIONS, ADDITIONS AND DELETIONS. The International
Existing Building Code, 2015 Edition (hereinafter known as the IEBC), is amended as hereinafter set out
in Sections 159.04 through 159.08.

159.04 - - DELETIONS. The following are deleted from the IEBC and are of no force or effect in this
chapter:

Section 105.1.1 Annual Permit
Section 105.1.2 Annual Permits Record
Section 105.2 #1 Permit Requirement

HUXLEY EXISTING BUILDING CODE 1



Prepared by Dave Kuhn, Council, and reformatted by John Haldeman, City Administrator for the Huxley City Council
meeting to be held on the 9th day of January, 2018,

ORDINANCE NO. 470

AN ORDINANCE CREATING CHAPTER 154 PROPERTY MAINTENANCE AND HOUSING
CODE, OF THE MUNICIPAL CODE OF THE CITY OF HUXLEY, IOWA, BY ADOPTING
THE 2015 INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE WITH AMENDMENTS

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Huxley, Iowa desires to continue to protect life, safety
and property through the adoption and enforcement of construction codes, and to establish the minimum
requirements to safeguard the public health, safety and general welfare through affordability, structural
strength, means of egress facilities, stability, sanitation, adequate light and ventilation, energy conservation,
to ensure that rental housing facilities and conditions are of sufficient quality to protect and promote the
health, safety and welfare of those persons utilizing such housing, and safety to life and property from fire
and other hazards attributed to the built environment and to provide safety to fire fighters and emergency
responders during emergency operations;

WHEREAS, the Council now deems it appropriate to revise the Municipal Code by adopting the
latest edition of the International Code Council Property Maintenance Code.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
HUXLEY, IOWA:

1. That Chapter 154 of the Municipal Code of the City of Huxley, Iowa, the Housing Code Regulations be
created and there be enacted in lieu thereof the following Chapter;

154.01 SHORT TITLE. This chapter shall be known as the Huxley Property Maintenance and Housing
Code, and may be cited as such, and may be referred to herein as this chapter

154,02 ADOPTION OF PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE. The International Property
Maintenance Code 2015 Edition; published by the International Code Council, Inc., is adopted in full except
for such portions as may be hereinafter deleted, modified or amended. A copy of the International Property
Maintenance Code 2015 Edition, as adopted and a copy of this chapter are on file in the office of the Code
Official.

154.03 AMENDMENTS, MODIFICATIONS, ADDITIONS AND DELETIONS. The International
Property Maintenance Code, 2015 Edition (hereinafter known as the IPMC), is amended as hereinafter set
out in Sections 154.04 through 154.13.

154.04 DELETIONS. The following are deleted from the IPMC and are of no force or effect in this
chapter:

Section - 111 Means Of Appeal

154.05 REFERENCED CODES - - CONFLICTS. In the event requirements of this code conflict with
applicable State and Federal requirements, the more stringent shall apply.

HUXLEY PROPERTY MAINTENANCE and HOUSING CODE 1



Prepared by Dave Kuhn, Council, and reformatted by John Haldeman, City Administrator for the Huxley City Council
meeting to be held on the 9th day of January, 2018,

ORDINANCE NO. 471

AN ORDINANCE CREATING CHAPTER 161 PLUMBING CODE, OF THE MUNICIPAL
CODE OF THE CITY OF HUXLEY, IOWA, BY ADOPTING THE 2015 INTERNATIONAL
PLUMBING CODE WITH AMENDMENTS

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Huxley, Iowa desires to continue to protect life, safety and
property through the adoption and enforcement of construction codes, and to establish the minimum
standards to safeguard life or limb, health, property and public welfare by regulating and controlling the
design, construction, installation, quality of materials, location, operation and maintenance or use of
plumbing equipment and systems;

WHEREAS, the Council now deems it appropriate to revise the Municipal Code by adopting the latest
edition of the International Plumbing Code.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF HUXLEY,
JOWA:

1. That Chapter 161 of the Municipal Code of the City of Huxley, Iowa, the Plumbing Regulations be
created and there be enacted in lieu thereof the following Chapter;

161.01 SHORT TITLE.

This chapter shall be known as the Huxley Plumbing Code, and may be cited as such, and may be referred
1o herein as this chapter

161.02 ADOPTION OF PLUMBING CODE.
The International Plumbing Code 2015 Edition; published by the International Code Council, Inc., is
adopted in full except for such portions as may be hereinafier deleted, modified or amended. A copy of the

International Plumbing Code 2015 Edition, as adopted, and a copy of this chapter are on file in the office
of the Code Official.

161.03 AMENDMENTS, MODIFICATIONS, ADDITIONS AND DELETIONS.

The International Plumbing Code, 2015 Edition (hereinafter known as the TPC), is amended as
hereinafler set out in Sections 161.04 through 161.19.

HUXLEY PLUMBING CODE 1




Prepared by Dave Kuhn, Council, and reformatted by John Haldeman, City Administrator for the Huxley City Council
meeting to be held on the 9th day of January, 2018.

ORDINANCE NO. 472

AN ORDINANCE CREATING CHAPTER 162 MECHANICAL CODE, OF THE MUNICIPAL
CODE OF THE CITY OF HUXLEY, IOWA, BY ADOPTING THE 2015 INTERNATIONAL
MECHANICAL CODE WITH AMENDMENTS

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Huxley, Iowa desires to continue to protect life, safety
and property through the adoption and enforcement of construction codes, and to establish the minimum
standards to safeguard life or limb, health, property and public weifare by regulating and controlling the
design, construction, installation, quality of materials, location, operation and maintenance or use of
mechanical systems;

WHEREAS, the Council now deems it appropriate to revise the Municipal Code by adopting the
latest edition of the International Code Council Mechanical Code.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
HUXLEY, IOWA:

1. That Chapter 162 of the Municipal Code of the City of Huxley, Iowa, the Mechanical Regulations
be created and there be enacted in lieu thereof the following Chapter;

162.01 SHORT TITLE. This chapter shall be known as the Huxley Mechanical Code, and may be cited
as such, and may be referred o herein as this chapter

162.02 ADOPTION OF MECHANICAL CODE. The International Mechanical Code 2015 Edition;
published by the International Code Council, Inc., is adopted in full except for such portions as may be
hereinafter deleted, modified or amended. A copy of the International Mechanical Code 2015 Edition, as
adopted and a copy of this chapter are on file in the office of the Code Official.

162.03 AMENDMENTS, MODIFICATIONS, ADDITIONS AND DELETIONS. The International
Mechanical Code, 2015 Edition (hereinafter known as the IMC), is amended as hereinafter set out in
Sections 162.04 through 162.15.

162.04 DELETIONS. The following are deleted from the IMC and are of no force or effect in this chapter:
Section 106.1,1 Annual Permit

Section 106.1.2 Annual Permits Record

Section 106.4.4 Extensions

Section 109 Means of Appeal

162.05 REFERENCED CODES - - CONFLICTS. In the event requirements of this code conflict with
applicable State and/or Federal requirements, the more stringent shall apply.

HUXLEY MECHANICAL CODE 1



Prepared by Dave Kuhn, Council, and reformatted by John Haldemsan, City Administrator for the Huxley City Council
meeting to be held on the 9th day of Janvary, 2018,

ORDINANCE NO. 473

AN ORDINANCE CREATING CHAPTER 160 SWIMMING POOL AND SPA CODE, OF THE
MUNICIPAL CODE OF THE CITY OF HUXLEY, IOWA, BY ADOPTING THE 2015
INTERNATIONAL SWIMMING POOL AND SPA CODE WITH AMENDMENTS

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Huxley, lowa desires to continue to protect life, safety
and property through the adoption and enforcement of construction codes, and to establish the minimum
standards to safeguard life or limb, health, property and public welfare by regulating and controlling the
design, construction, installation, quality of materials, location, operation and maintenance or use of
swimming pool and spa equipment and systems;

WHEREAS, the Council now deems it appropriate to revise the Municipal Code by adopting the
latest edition of the International Swimming Pool and Spa Code.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
HUXLEY, IOWA:

1. That Chapter 160 of the Municipal Code of the City of Huxley, Iowa, the Swimming Pool and Spa Code
be enacted in the following Chapter;

160.01 SHORT TITLE.

This chapter shall be known as the Huxley Swimming Pool and Spa Code, and may be cited as such, and
may be referred to herein as this chapter

160.02 ADOPTION OF SWIMMING POOI. AND SPA CODE.
The International Swimming Pool and Spa Code 2015 Edition; published by the International Code Council,
Inc., is adopted in full except for such portions as may be hereinafter deleted, modified or amended. A copy
of the International Swimming Pool and Spa Code 2015 Edition, as adopted, and a copy of this chapter are
on file in the office of the Code Official.

160.03 AMENDMENTS, MODIFICATIONS, ADDITIONS AND DELETIONS.

The International Swimming Pool and Spa Code, 2015 Edition (hereinafter known as the ISPSC), is
amended as hereinafter set out in Sections 160.04 through 160.12.

160.04 - - DELETIONS.
The following are deleted from the ISPSC and are of no force or effect in this chapter:

Section 105.5.4 Extensions
Section 108 Means of Appeal

HUXLEY SWIMMING POOL AND SPA CODE 1



Prepared by Dave Kuhn, Council, and reformatted by John Haldeman, City Administrator for the Huxley City Council
meeting to be held on the 9th day of January, 2018,

ORDINANCE NO. 474

AN ORDINANCE CREATING CHAPTER 164 BUILDING AND PROPERTY REGULATIONS,
OF THE MUNICIPAL CODE OF THE CITY OF HUXLEY, IOWA, BY ADOPTING THE 2017
NATIONAL ELECTRIC CODE aka NFPA 70

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Huxley, Iowa desires to continue to protect life, safety
and property through the adoption and enforcement of construction codes, and to establish the minimum
standards to safeguard life or limb, health, property and public welfare by regulating and controlling the
design, construction, installation, quality of materials, location, operation and maintenance or use of
mechanical systems;

WHEREAS, the Council now deems it appropriate to revise the Municipal Code by adopting the
latest edition of the National Electrical Code.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
HUXLEY, [OWA:

1. That Chapter 164 of the Municipal Code of the City of Huxley, lowa, the Electrical Regulations be
created and there be enacted in lieu thereof the following Chapter;

164.01 SHORT TITLE. This chapter shall be known as the Huxley Electrical code, and may be cited as
such, and may be referred to herein as this chapter

164.02 ADOPTION OF ELECTRICAL CODE. Pursuant to notice as required by law, the National
Electric Code 2017 Edition; published by the National Fire Protection Association (NFPA 70), is adopted
in full except for such portions as may be hereinafter deleted, modified or amended. An official copy of the

National Electric Code 2017 Edition, as adopted and a certified copy of this chapter are on file in the office
of the Code Official.

164.03 AMENDMENTS, MODIFICATIONS, ADDITIONS. The National Electric Code, 2017 Edition
(hereinafter known as the NEC), is amended as hereinafter set out in Sections 164.04 through 164.13.

164.04 REFERENCED CODES - - CONFLICTS. In the event there are requirements of this code that
conflict with applicable State and Federal requirements, the more stringent shall apply.

164.05 Deletions. The following are deleted from the NEC and are of no force or effect in this chapter:

Section 210.12B Branch Circuit Extensions or Modifications - Dwelling Units
Section 406.4(d){(4) Arc Fault Circuit-Interrupter Protection

164.06 ADDITION - - TITLE. Title, of the NEC is hereby established by adding the following:

Title. These regulations shall be known as the Huxley Electrical Code hereinafter known as “this code.”

HUXLEY ELECTRICAL CODE 1



Prepared by Dave Kuhn, Council, and reformatted by John Haldeman, City Administrator for the Huxley City Council
meeting to be held on the 9th day of January, 2018.

ORDINANCE NO. 475

AN ORDINANCE CREATING CHAPTER 163 FUEL GAS CODE, OF THE MUNICIPAL CODE
OF THE CITY OF HUXLEY, IOWA, BY ADOPTING THE 2015 INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS
CODE WITH AMENDMENTS

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Huxley, Iowa desires to continue to protect life safety
and property through the adoption and enforcement of construction codes, and to establish the minimum
standards to safeguard life or limb, health, property and public welfare by regulating and controlling the
design, construction, installation, quality of materials, location, operation and maintenance or use of fuel
gas systems,;

WHEREAS, the Council now deems it appropriate to revise the Municipal Code by adopting the
latest edition of the International Code Council Fuel Gas Code.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
HUXLEY, IOWA:

1. That Chapter 163 of the Municipal Code of the City of Huxley, Iowa, the Fuel Gas Regulations be enacted
in the following Chapter;

163.01 SHORT TITLE. This chapter shall be known as the Huxley Fuel Gas Code, and may be cited as
such, and may be referred to herein as this chapter

163.02 ADOPTION OF FUEL GAS CODE. The International Fuel Gas Code 2015 Edition; published
by the International Code Council, Inc., is adopted in full except for such portions as may be hereinafier
deleted, modified or amended. A copy of the International Fuel Gas Code 2015 Edition, as adopted and a
copy of this chapter are on file in the office of the Code Official.

163.03 AMENDMENTS, MODIFICATIONS, ADDITIONS AND DELETIONS. The International
Fuel Gas Code, 2015 Edition (hereinafter known as the IFGC), is amended as hereinafter set out in Sections
163.04 through 163.15.

163.04 - - DELETIONS. The following are deleted from the IFGC and are of no force or effect in this
chapter:

Section 106.1.1 Annual Permit

Section 106.1.2 Annual Permits Record
Section 106.5.4 Extensions

Section 109 Board of Appeals.

163.05 REFERENCED CODES - - CONFLICTS. In the event requirements of this code conflict with
applicable State and/or Federal requirements, the more stringent shall apply.

HUXLEY FUEL GAS CODE 1



Prepared by John Haldeman, City Administrator, for the City Council meeting to be held on the
13th day of February, 2018.

RESOLUTION NO. 18-007

RESOLUTION APPROVING SITE PLAN FOR LOT #3 DEVELOPMENT IN THE
HUXLEY BUSINESS PARK ON MAIN AVE.

WHEREAS, Pro Commercial LLC has submitted a site plan for Lot 3 in the Huxley Business
Park on South Main Ave.; and

WHEREAS, the Huxley Planning and Zoning Commission reviewed the site plan for this
location at their January 29, 2018 meeting; and

WHEREAS, ithe Commission voted to recommend approval of the site plan to the Huxley City
Council for their February 13, 2018 meeting.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF HUXLEY,

IOWA, that the Huxley City Council has reviewed said site plan and the City’s Engineer’s approves of the
Site Plan, Council moves for its approval

Roll Call Aye Nay Absent
Dave Jensen
Dave Kuhn
Greg Mulder
Rick Peterson

Tracey Roberts

PASSED AND APPROVED this ___ day of February, 2018.



APPROVAL BY MAYOR

I hereby approve the foregoing Resolution No. 18-007 by affixing below my official
signature as Mayor of the City of Huxley, Iowa, this  day of February, 2018.

Craig D. Henry, Mayor

ATTEST:

Jolene Lettow, City Clerk



VEENSTRA & KiMM, INC.

3000 Westown Parkway = West Des Moines, lowa 50266-1320
575-225-8000 « 575-225-7848 (FAX) « 800-241-8000 (WATS)

February 5, 2018

John Haldeman

City Administrator
City of Huxley

515 N. Main Avenue
Huxley, lowa 50124

HUXLEY, IOWA
HUXLEY INDUSTRIAL PARK LOT 3
SITE PLAN

We have reviewed the revised site plan for Lot 3 of the Huxley Industrial Park and find it
acceptable.

If you have any questions or comments, please contact us at 515-225-8000.

\\./_EI'ENSTRA & KIMM, INC.
ff[WﬂJ\ (&QQ!;Q

Forrest S. Aldrich

FSA:dml

45229-024

cc:  Nate Easter, Easter & Associates (e-mail)
Jeff Peterson, City of Huxley (e-mail)
Scott Renaud, Fox Engineering Associates, Inc. (e-mail)
Grant Tjernagel, Pro Commercial (e-mail)

West Des Moines, IA « Coralvilfe, IA « Mason City, IA » Sioux City, IA » Rock Island, IL « Springheld, IL = Liberly. MO



Prepared by John Haldeman, City Administrator, for the City Council meeting to be held on the
13th day of Februnary, 2018.

RESOLUTION NO. 18-008

RESOLUTION APPROVING SITE PLAN IMPROVEMENT FOR VILLAS @ 315
IN HUXLEY, IOWA

WHEREAS, Kading Properties has submitted a site plan for 76 apartments (38 attached units}) east of
511 East First Street; and

WHERFEAS, the Huxley Planning and Zoning Commission reviewed said site plan at their January 29,
2018 meeting; and

WHEREAS, the Commission voted to recommend approval of the site plan to the City Council with
noted items per minutes; and

WHEREAS, Meadow Lane Investments, LLC is the owner of the property and that Kading Properties
is purchasing this real estate and proceeding with the consent of Meadow Lane Investments LLC.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF HUXLEY, IOWA, that
the Huxley City Council has reviewed said site plan and approves the site plan subject to the following
conditions and/or waivers;

1. It is understood that the following lists the steps that will be followed:

Approval by Council of the Villas @ 315 site plan.

Approval by City staff of the construction plans for Deerwood Drive and the Villas @ 315.
Construction by Kading of Deerwood Drive and the Villas @ 315 utilities and streets.

City Council acceptance of the public streets and public infrastructure within the development.
City Council approval of the final plat and submit and file covenants/HOA.

oo op

2. Conditions to be completed and approved as set out in Engineer’s Review Letter.

Building plans are submitted for review and if everything is in order and fees have been paid the City
will issue building permits

Roll Call Aye Nay Absent
David Jensen
David Kuhn
Greg Mulder
Rick Peterson

Tracey Roberts

PASSED AND APPROVED this __ day of February, 2018.



APPROVAL BY MAYOR

I hereby approve the foregoing Resolution No. 18-008 by affixing below my official signature as
Mayor of the City of Huxley, lowa, this ___ day of February, 2018.

Craig D. Henry, Mayor

ATTEST:

Jolene Lettow, City Clerk



F i

f Planning and Zoning Commission

| Fi

AT R
[ F (" “f Minutes
41
Monday January 29, 2018
HHEE QXHEIFZ.,'EE Y Huxley Council Chambers
7:00 P.M.

1.0) CALL TO ORDER AND ROLL CALL:

Acting Chairman Mike Schonhorst called the P&Z Meeting to order at 7:00 PM. P&Z members present:

Roger Bierbaum O Larry Wilson |
Cheryl Patterson M Joe Scott [
Mike Schonhorst %] Nate Easter |
Gordon Mosher O

Staff present: John Haldeman-Zoning Administrator
Amy Kaplan-Zoning Clerk

Consultants present: Amy Beattie-City Attorney
Forest Aldrich-City Engineer

Council members present: Dave Jensen, Rick Peterson
Guests present: Dan Novelli, Mark Lee, Matt Eller, Grant Tjernagel, Steve Quick, Duane Jensen, Scott Renaud

COMMISSION AGENDA ITEMS:
2.0) MOTION TO APPROVE THE MINUTES FROM THE FOLLOWING MEETING:

2.1) NOVEMBER 13, 2017 REGULAR MEETING - Motion by Easter and seconded by Wilson to
approve minutes. Roll was taken. 4 AYE. 0 NAY

3.0) PUBLIC HEARING: None

4.0) DISCUSSION AND RECOMMENDATION ITEMS:
4.1) DISCUSSION AND POSSIBLE RECOMMENDATION ON SITE PLAN FOR

VILLAS @ 315 ON EAST FIRST STREET. Discussion took place regarding each
item in the letter dated January 26, 2018 from Veenstra & Kimm. Motion by Easter and
seconded by Wilson to recommend approval of this site plan to City Council pending
each item on the letter has been completed/addressed to City Staff prior to the City
Council meeting on February 13th. John and Forest are to report unresolved items to
Council on the 13™. Please see attached for specifics. 4 AYE 0 NAY.

4.2) DISCUSSION AND POSSIBLE RECOMMENDATION ON SITE PLAN FOR
LOT 3, HUXLEY INDUSTRIAL PARK. Discussion took place regarding each item in
the letter dated January 26, 2018 from Veenstra & Kimm. Motion by Easter and
seconded by Patterson to recommend approval of this site plan to City Council on
February 13" pending prior staff and engineer comments. 4 AYE 0 NAY.



5.0) MISCELLANEOUS: None

6.0) COMMENTS AND UPDATES:
® Schonhorst appreciates City Staff attempting to meet contractor’s deadlines

7.0) ADJOURNMENT — Motion by Easter to adjourn at 8:56 PM, seconded by Patterson. 4 AYE. 0 NAY.

Amy Kaplan, Zoning Clerk

Mike Schonhorst, Acting Chairman Date of Approval



1. {166.10.4) All water mains, including hydrants and hydrant leads, within the development are proposed to be public
water mains. This does not include water services. Water services from the main to the residence will be
private. Easements are to be shown on the final plat for the water mains. Easement documents will be
prepared and submitted to the City and will stipulate the following:

a. The City will he responsible for the maintenance and repair of the water mains and hydrants.

b. The developer will be responsible for all replacement work beyond the water main including subgrade
compaction and pavement replacement.

All other utilities within the development will be private including all sanitary and storm sewers. There needs to
be a discussion on whether the City wants the water mains within the development to be public or private.

There are good arguments for this both ways. The private argument is there is precedence for this arrangement
such as the mehile home park just to the west and the City does not have the expense of future maintenance
costs. The public argument is that for better water quality it would be best to have the system looped (mobile
home park has just one connection, Kading proposing three connections) and the City then has control over
repairs to make sure the water supply is kept safe.

Planning & Zoning Commission would prefer that the main is looped and inspected by the City but wants Council
to decide on if the water is public or private.

2. The developer is proposing to install a 10-foot wide trail on the east side of Deerwood Drive in lieu of a 5-foot
wide sidewalk on the west side of Deerwood Drive. There are existing trees along the west property line next to
the mobiie home park that will make the installation of a sidewalk difficult in this area if the trees are to be
protected.

Comp plan shows a trail. P&Z is ok with eliminating the 5tt sidewalk requirement on the west side of Deerwood
Drive and making the east side a 10ft foot wide trail.

3. Ifatrail is installed on the east side of Deerwood Drive then there needs to be a discussion on how the trail is
connected to the Heart of lowa Trail spur located just to the west of the southwest corner of the site.

It is proposed that the trail on the east side of Deerwood extend to 1 street, however, the commission would
like council to decide on what they foresee for that area in the future and how to connect to the existing trail.
The commission indicated that a mid-block crossing is not as safe a crossing at an intersection.

4. The north end of Deerwood Drive connects differently than what is shown on the preliminary plat for Meadow
Lane to the north. Possible changes to the Meadow Lane Preliminary Plat need to be discussed and determined,.

it was decided that a new preliminary plat is needed when Meadow Lane Phase 4 is developed. Kading and
Steve Quick will salve between themselves and provide a written agreement to the City before council on
February 13th.



5.

10.

11.

The storm sewer outlet at the northeast carner of the mobile home park and the storm sewer outlet from the
north detention basin for the development will impact the preliminary plat for Meadow Lane. Possible changes
to the Meadow Lane Preliminary Plat need to be discussed and determined.

It was decided that a new preliminary plat is needed when Meadow Lane Phase 4 is developed. Kading and
Steve Quick will solve between themselves and provide a written agreement to the City before council on
February 13th.

Subdivision Ordinance 165.05.44 requires parking spaces to be not less than 200 square feet. The proposed
parking stalls are 9 feet by 18 feet or 162 square feet. A decision needs to be made on a variance for the smaller

parking spaces.

No variance is needed as the proposed meets code. Some discussion is needed on the length of the parking

spaces.
A traffic study needs to be provided and evaluated.

Planning & Zoning Commission agrees.

A lighting plan needs to be provided and evaluated.
Planning & Zoning Commission agrees,

Construction plans for Deerwood Drive need to be provided.
Planning & Zoning Commission agrees.

Subdivision Ordinance 165.24.4.C. requires a minimum 26-foot wide pavement for the interior private streets.
Twenty-two foot (22-foot) wide streets are being proposed meeting Subdivision Ordinance 165.33.4 for private
access drives. A determination needs to be made on the width of the interior pavement.

The proposed street width of 22 feet does not meet Huxley code of 26 feet. If the code did not specify 26 feet,
the Planning & Zoning commission would not have a problem with the street width. Kading is indicating these
are not streets or roadways. Huxley code states:

All interior private roadways shall be paved according to City standards for residential street
pavement construction with a minimum pavement width of 26 feet, measured back to
back of curb.

“Private roadway” means a paved access, private right-of-way which is for private usage and
ingress and egress to a public street.

Discussion and a decision is needed.

Subdivision Ordinance 166.21.7 states that lots shall not have access onto an arterial street unless unavoidable.
E. First Street is an arterial street. The site plan shows an access onto E. First Street in the southeast corner of
the site. This access would be across from the existing east daycare driveway. A decision needs to be made on
a variance for this access point.

It is recommended that the far east access from 1% Street is eliminated as it is in violation of Ordinance 166.21.7



VEENSTRA & KIMM, INC,

3000 Westown Parkway » West Des Moines, fowa 50266-1320
515-225-8000 » 515-225-7848 (FAX) « B00-241-8000 (WATS)

February 8, 2018

John Haldeman

City Administrator
City of Huxley

515 N. Main Avenue
Huxley, lowa 50124

HUXLEY, IOWA
VILLAS @ 315
SITE PLAN

We have reviewed the revised site plan for the Villas @ 315 and find it acceptable with the
following items and additional items that need to be considered by the City Council:

1. (166.10.4) All water mains, including hydrants and hydrant leads, within the
development are proposed to be public water mains. This does not include water
services. Water services from the main to the residence will be private. Easements
are to be shown on the final plat for the water mains. Easement documents will be
prepared and submitted to the City and will stipulate the following:

a. The City will be responsible for the maintenance and repair of the water mains
and hydrants,

b. The developer will be responsible for all replacement work beyond the water
main including subgrade compaction and pavement replacement.

All other utilities within the development will be private including all sanitary and
storm sewers. There needs to be a discussion on whether or not the City wants the
water mains within the development to be public or private.

There are good arguments for this bath ways. The private argument is there is
precedence for this arrangement such as the mobile home park just to the west and
the City does not have the expense of future maintenance costs. The public
argument is that for better water quality it would be best to have the system looped
{mobile home park has just one connection, Kading proposing three connections)
and the City then has control over repairs to make sure the water supply is kept
safe.

West Des Moaines, IA » Coralville, IA « Mason City, JA = Sioux City, IA = Rock Island, IL « Springfield, IL « Liberty, MO



John Haldeman
February 8, 2018

Page 2

2.

The developer is proposing to install a 10-foot wide trail on the east side of
Deerwood Drive in lieu of a 5-foot wide sidewalk on the west side of Deerwood
Drive. There are existing trees along the west property line next to the mobile
home park that will make the installation of a sidewalk difficult in this area if the
trees are to be protected. The City’s comprehensive plan shows a trail to be
extended along Deerwood Drive.

The north end of Deerwood Drive connects differently than what is shown on the
preliminary plat for Meadow Lane to the north. The storm sewer outlet at the
northeast corner of the mobile home park and the storm sewer outlet from the north
detention basin for the development will impact the preliminary plat for Meadow
Lane. Planning and Zoning recommended the Meadow Lane preliminary plat be
changed to reflect the proposed changes for the Viflas @ 315 before the next
development is constructed in the Meadow Lane subdivision. We have requested
that Steve Quick, the owner of the Meadow Lane subdivision, provide a written
statement that he is agreeable to the proposed improvements associated with the
Villas @ 315 as it affects the Meadow Lane subdivision.

City Ordinance 166.20.16 states the pavement width of Deerwood Drive shall be
34 feet wide with parking allowed on one side. SUDAS Design Standard

Table SC-1.01 states the pavement width of Deerwood Drive shall be 34 feet wide
parking allowed on one side (matching the ordinance) or shall be 31 feet wide with
no parking allowed. The developer is propesing the pavement width of Deerwood
Drive to be 31 feet wide with no parking allowed.

The plan as presented to Planning and Zoning was for 22 feet wide private streets
with a 4-foot sidewalk on one side. City Ordinance 165.24.4.C requires a
minimum pavement width of 26 feet. The site plan has been revised for 26 feet
wide private streets with no sidewalks except for a sidewalk on the north side of the
middle east/west street extending from Deerwood Drive to the middle north/south
street.

In addition to the above City Council considerations we have the following additional
comments:

1.

2.

3.

We have reviewed the traffic study and find it acceptable.
We have reviewed the stormwater study and find it acceptable.

A lighting plan needs to be provided and evaluated as a part of the Deerwood Drive
construction plans.



John Haldeman
February 8, 2018

Page 3

4. A pavement design determination needs to be performed for Deerwood Drive as a
part of the Deerwood Drive construction plans.

5. Construction plans for Deerwood Drive need to be provided.

6. The following comments need to be addressed by Kading Properties and
Lee Chamberlin Consultant Engineers:

a,

In the southeast detention basin showing a 6-foot wide flume from the detention
basin to the sidewalk on the north side of East First. Purpose of the flume?

Believe current ADA will require an opposite ramp be installed on the south
side of East First opposite the trail ramp on the north side. Please review.

A culvert is shown running east and west under the throat to the temporary turn
around. It appears the ground can be graded such that the drainage can be
directed northward around the turn around and the culvert deleted.

Planning and Zoning’s comment was to connect the outlet storm sewer from the
mobile home park in the northwest corner and pipe it to the north detention
basin. Please approach the mobile home park concerning permission to get on
their property to make the connection and delete the open drainage channel.

The detention basin outlet pipes need to be RCP. The south two outlet pipes
extend into the East First R.O.W. The north detention basin outlet pipe will
extend into the R.O.W. of a future street.

The City’s comprehensive plan shows the land to the east of the development
scheduled to be single family residential. Please provide vegetative screening
plant materials aiong the east property line boundary.

The temporary turnaround at the north end of Deerwood Drive needs to be hard
surfaced with asphalt or concrete in accordance with City Ordinance 166.20.10.



John Haldeman
February 8, 2018
Page 4

If you have any questions or comments concerning the project, please contact us at
515-225-8000,

VEENSTRA & KIMM, INC.

o MY

Forrest S. Aldrich

FSA:dml
45229-023
cc:  Mark Lee, Lee Chamberlin Consultant Engineers (e-mail)

leff Peterson, City of Huxley (e-mail)
Dan Novelli, Kading Properties {(e-mail)



[ le mN. 1 ( Cp < .l :AWS
[y = = o =

S — o8 oF ] Or
wmaﬁ

wr

.-.- T
aive
EET)

r arsimey

TN

1ad sdavin

)

dVi
HAVNIVHT
SNOILIANQD

AIQ-FEA

FILiZ _BNiaY;

)

oo rram3vs sspusay
SETLHICY TIVMI
SELP-NRY 1S T
16208 YROIWALIR A¥a
LTS WS LIS

PPN
e

.

e

-

-
g
-

S

= “

>3 “

m |

< 1

h 1
= |
=~ w.wﬁulnlml\.\JaLI\\lﬁf J

—| —_— e = = &

S = = un.m_u.n.unn\“uk-‘l.nuum\ e
- = e s

Zz o

o @

—

—

— s

= P

.n.Ip.h

=

=

T

: /
To-E102 an mmr\ LAHAHS ; m:mm
|/ Mavd BNOH mdmoz

7]
AbFD divia donn \_




\NlQJ [ 0w - L 3W35 YRV
[— = g P #aN

amaag od oF a ur ! [
¥Z04LT Gy T R RN
Iriri L —— x
Wi-eo-20 TN
] palh) i 3
{ f , —
I v \ /w, / ~
i y < .
\ R
3 e s
Y
\ 5
| W X ;
! L T Lﬂdl_u P
f Py N M :
/ } .4
! HBEE N G \
/ 2 i Y JE @
\.\ I ¥ 1 !
! 4 H i h
/ ..M. ! Sy
arnsssuedics-sujpsor auiol s al| | A £l.c
3TH¥ TND Fy ¥ D v -
-0 115 TR / b b Y | ] i =
153D VA0 LA KPA s o Iy
ATHAR 2T 2NE \\ =
=1 7 n.“.
-
r Fo _ﬂ dal Ao .‘— NS eﬂ, L
i W
g cw A .
i 1 hY
! L | Y

z /
ul & __1 =
i M “z 2
P Y
el
T e 7 ZNO¥T 0%,
— oy
ar =
_\l i = Y g, TRl
e ~—— o 1 Lz P -d
m s L v B1'0=vid ) o
—< /ov dvo=viy w3080 000PIA0 OV--61Q=BIE T oA\
= T Bro=aLy, > = = g 2
A > = = =N / AN
g M = i PR Rathel - ==
e T et / - Y, T, Ty
B e T ESs——= ’ 7 .\ \\\ A dmsis

INNOJ AHOLS
GIE 9 SYTIIA

8y
EAY

VMO

€a 1
AdvVd d4WOH

=
=3
Eafen

dpdatdnes aasA
299 ANFHIEIIING




TR

PARTU)

STINOAY VNI
SLy-saN G1RIITIL
16302 TA0IWILIN GVa
ATILF HLER SE

S
1
=
=
>
Mm
v =
—
=
o
e
O @
O
— 3
=
= O
—
-]
=
=

05 = 4 AWOS
[

s

A¥YINNOA
JO¥NIvEd

ov/arers

ra

V'a

9




PUBLIC SAFETY



Prepared by John Haldeman, City Administrator for Huxley, lowa, City Council Meeting on the 13" day
’ of February, 2018.

RESOLUTION NO. 18-009

RESOLUTION APPROVING THE ATTACHED 28 E FOR ALL LAW ENFORCEMENT
AGENCIES IN STORY COUNTY.

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Huxley, lowa at their February 13, 2018
meeting was presented with a copy of a 28E Agreement for all law enforcement agencies in Story

County.

BE IT RESOLVED, THEREFORE, that the City Council of Huxley, Jowa does hereby
approve the said polices, which is attached, and authorizes the Mayor to sign.

All resolutions or parts thereof in conflict herewith are hereby repealed.

Roll Call Aye Nay Absent

David Jensen
David Kuhn . .
Greg Mulder o o .
Rick Peterson

Tracey Roberts

PASSED, ADOPTED AND APPROVED this _ th day of February, 2018

APPROVAL BY MAYOR

L hereby approve the foregoing Resolution No. 18-009 by affixing below my official
signature as Mayor of the City of Huxley, Iowa, this __th day of February, 2018.

Craig D. Henry, Mayor
ATTEST:

Jolene Lettow, City Clerk



INTERGOVERNMENTAL 288 AGREEMENT FOR
COMBINED LAW ENFORCEMENT OPERATIONS

THIS AGREEMENT, made by and among the County of Story, Iowa, the City of Ames,
Iowa, the City of Nevada, lowa, the City of Story City, Iowa, the City of Huxley, Iowa, Story
County Conservation, and Iowa State University of Science and Technology, with their
respective law enforcement agencies, the Story County Sheriff’s Office, the Ames Police
Department (hereinafter “Ames PD™), the Nevada Public Safety Department (hereinafter
“Nevada PD”), the Story City Police Department (hereinafter “Story City PD”), the Huxley
Police Department (hereinafter “Huxley PD”), Story County Conservation Public Safety
(hereinafter “Story County PS”), and the Iowa State University of Science and Technology
Department of Public Safety (hereinafter “ISU DPS”), (hereinafter collectively “the Parties™), is
entered into to permit combined law enforcement activities within their boundaries pursuant to
Chapter 28E of the Iowa Code, providing as follows:

I.  PURPOSE

WHEREAS, this Agreement does not contemplate and shall not be construed to limit or
expand the powers of the participating entities, except as expressly stated in this Agreement;

WHEREAS, the undersigned entities provide law enforcement services to their respective
constituents; and

WHEREAS, the Parties recognize that in certain situations, the use of law enforcement
officers and other law enforcement employees to perform law enforcement duties outside of the
territorial limits of the political subdivision or institution where such officers are legally
employed may be desirable and necessary to preserve and protect the health, safety, and welfare
of the public; and

WHEREAS, the Parties recognize that there are certain types of criminal activities or
trends that are a local, regional, state, and/or national problem involving violations of laws that
cross political jurisdictional lines and that law enforcement officers from the jurisdictions listed
in this Agreement may be called to render assistance to officers and/or become independently
involved in law enforcement activities outside of their respective political subdivision or
institution. The parties further recognize that there are certain prearranged law enforcement tasks
that may be planned which will involve participation of law enforcement officers from all Parties
and that these tasks may take place outside of their respective subdivision or institution; and

WHEREAS, the Parties recognize that there are certain criminal activities or investigative
tasks that the officers identified in this Agreement may become independently involved in
outside of their jurisdiction without participation of any officers of the jurisdiction where those
activities are taking place.

IT IS, THEREFORE, the purpose of this Agreement to permit the Parties, through their
respective law enforcement agencies, to share personnel for the purpose of combined routine
patrol, investigations, and any other law enforcement related activities as the Parties deem

appropriate.



II. NATURE OF AGREEMENT

This Agreement is made pursuant to Chapter 28E, Code of lowa. This Agreement is to
permit joint law enforcement activities by the Parties. No separate legal entity is established by
this Agreement. Each Party shall independently finance and budget for its activities under this
Agreement. No real or personal property will be purchased, held or disposed of in the
performance of this Agreement.

III. MUTUAL AID

Mutual aid means a voluntary exchange of services, personnel, and/or equipment among
the Parties.

Mutual aid may be provided between and among the Parties during a natural disaster,
public disorder, State emergency, other emergency, or routine police work when it would best
serve the interests of the Parties and public within the respective jurisdictions.

All law enforcement personnel employed by each party shall have authority to render
mutual aid at the request of personnel from another party’s law enforcement agency unless such
authority is revoked or restricted by a commanding officer of either agency. Such revocation or
restriction may be made at any time, but not without first notifying the requesting party. A
request for aid may be made through commanding officers, through law enforcement dispatchers
or directly from one officer to another. In any case where mutual aid is rendered, every officer
involved shall report the extent of aid rendered to their respective commanding officers.

IV.  AUTHORITY OF PARTICIPATING OFFICERS

The officers designated pursuant to this Agreement shall have full powers as peace
officers when participating in the law enforcement activities identified in this Agreement
anywhere in the jurisdictions of the participating agencies. However, they shall have no greater
authority than they have when in their employing jurisdiction or institution.

The Police Chief of the City of Ames, the Sheriff of Story County, the Police Chief of
Nevada, the Police Chief of Story City, the Police Chief of Huxley, the Director of Public Safety
for Story County Conservation, and the Assistant Vice President/Chief of Police for the Director
of the Department of Public Safety at Jowa State University, or any officer commanding in their
absence, shall retain full command of and authority over officers employed by their respective
agencies at all times, even while in the process of rendering mutual aid, unless specific orders to
the contrary are issued by the officer’s commander. A delegation of command authority to
another agency shall not relieve the delegating Party from its obligations to hold harmless and
indemnify the other Parties to this Agreement as set forth below.

V. COMPENSATION

It shall be the responsibility of each party to this agreement to provide compensation to
its own personnel and to provide appropriate insurance for its personnel who may suffer injury,
disability, or death in the performance of official duties while assisting the other party under the



terms of this Agreement. No participating law enforcement agency shall be required to
compensate officers of another agency.

Each party to this Agreement shall be responsible for the issuance of, repairs, and
maintenance on its own vehicles and other equipment.

VI. LIABILITY
Employees or volunteers of any party acting pursuant to this Agreement shall be
considered as acting under the lawful orders and instructions pertaining to their employment or
volunteer status with such party. Under no circumstances are employees or volunteers of one
party to be considered employees or volunteers of the other party.

Each party waives all claims against the other for compensation for any property loss or
damage and/or personal injury or death to its personnel as consequence of the performance of
this Agreement unless such loss, damage, injury, or death arises from the negligent or willful
misconduct of a party. Each party shall bear the liability and/or costs of damage to its equipment
and facilities, and the compensation of its employees or volunteers, including injury and death of
its personnel, occurring as a consequence of the performance of this Agreement, whether the
damages, costs, injury, or death occurs at an emergency in the party’s own jurisdiction or in the
jurisdiction of the other party unless such damages, injury, liability, or death arises from the
negligent or willful misconduct of a party. Nothing in this Agreement is intended nor does it
waive any right to seek federal or other assistance provided for disaster relief,

A party shall hold harmless and indemnify the other parties from any liability to third
parties arising out of its negligent or willful misconduct, or arising from the execution of a
specific command or order pursuant to this Agreement. Nothing in this Agreement shall prevent
or limit any party to this Agreement from recovering or attempting to recover costs of services
rendered to a third party where such recovery of costs is provided for by law.

The Parties to this Agreement do not waive any defenses, immunities, or other limitations
applicable to a respective party and nothing herein shall be so construed. Each party to this
Agreement reserves the right to fully defend all claims arising from loss of or damage to private
property and/or death of or injury to private persons who are not parties to this Agreement
including, but not limited to asserting defenses of immunities available under applicable law.

This article shall survive the termination of this Agreement where necessary to protect
each party to this Agreement.

VII.  RULES AND REGULATIONS

The commanding officers of the participating law enforcement agencies are authorized to
establish the operational rules and regulations for the law enforcement officers’ conduct pursuant
to this Agreement, covering such matters as administrative duties and command responsibility
for the personnel and equipment involved.



Unless otherwise agreed by the respective parties to a specific case, the party requesting
mutual aid shall be responsible for original case preparation and filing criminal charges, if any.
In cases where this agreement in invoked to address potential or perceived conflict of interest,
the party leading the investigation will be responsible for case preparation and filing of criminal
charges. The secondary party shall provide supplementary reports as needed. Both parties shall
maintain their respective copies of criminal reports generated by a mutual aid request.

A swom officer making an arrest shall be responsible for maintaining custody and
writing reports generating from the arrest. If the arrest is based on officer observation or
investigation, that officer must file the appropriate criminal charge(s) (citation of complaint) with
the appropriate courts.

Officers responding outside of their jurisdiction will notify the agency whose jurisdiction
they are entering as soon as possible of the criminal activity.

VIII. TERM

The term of this Agreement shall commence when approved by the governing body of
each law enforcement agency and signed by the representative of each governing body and
continue until terminated as provided herein. The term of this Agreement shall end on February
28, 2028, unless previously terminated as provided herein.

This Agreement may be terminated at any time by the mutual agreement of all parties or
by the political entity authorizing this agreement by furnishing written notice to the other
agencies of the termination. All Parties to this Agreement must provide 90 days notice prior to
terminating participation in this Agreement. This Agreement would remain in effect as to the
non-terminating agencies, and an amendment to the Agreement made and filed. .

IX. AMENDMENTS

This Agreement represents the entire agreement of the parties. This Agreement is not
intended to supersede any prior agreements between participating agencies or prevent any of the
Parties from adopting other agreements relating to cooperative law enforcement activities. Any
amendments must be in writing, approved by the governing bodies of all Parties, and executed
by the auihorized representatives of all Parties. All executions, terminations, and amendments of
this Agreement will be filed in the office of the lowa Secretary of State, in accordance with
Chapter 28E.8 of the Code of lowa.

X. VALIDITY
In the event any part or paragraph of this Agreement is declared void as being contrary to
Iowa law, the remaining portions of the Agreement that are valid shall continue in full force and
effect.

XI.  APPLICABLE LAW
This Agreement shall be governed by and construed in accordance with the laws of the
State of Iowa (excluding conflict of laws rules), and applicable federal law.



XII. COUNTERPARTS
This Agreement may be executed in any number of counterparts, each of which shall be
deemed Lo be an original, but all such counterparts shall together constitute but one and the same
instrument.

XII. AUTHORITY

Each party to this Agreement represents and warrants to the other that it has the right,
power and authority to enter into and perform its obligations under this Agreement; and that it
has taken all requisite actions necessary to approve the execution, delivery and performance of
this Agreement.

IN WITNESS THEREOF, the parties have executed this Agreement on the dates given
below.



IOWA CODE CHAPTER 28E AGREEMENT
COUNTY PARTIES TO AGREEMENT

Story County, Iowa

By:-
Chairman, Board of Supervisors

Date:

ATTEST:

By:

County Auditor



City of Ames, lowa

By:

IOWA CODE CHAPTER 28E AGREEMENT
CITY PARTIES TO AGREEMENT

Mayor

Date:

ATTEST:

By:

City Clerk



City of Nevada, lowa

By:

IOWA CODE CHAPTER 28E AGREEMENT
CITY PARTIES TO AGREEMENT

Mayor

Date:

ATTEST:

By:

City Clerk



IOWA CODE CHAPTER 28E AGREEMENT
CITY PARTIES TO AGREEMENT

City of Story City, lowa

By:

Mayor

Date:

ATTEST:

By:
City Clerk




City of Huxley, lowa

By:

IOWA CODE CHAPTER 28E AGREEMENT
CITY PARTIES TO AGREEMENT

Mayor

Date:

ATTEST:

By:

City Clerk

10



IOWA CODE CHAPTER 28E AGREEMENT
COUNTY PARTIES TO AGREEMENT

Story County Conservation

By:

Chairman, Board of Directors

Date:

ATTEST:

By:

11



IOWA CODE CHAPTER 28E AGREEMENT
CITY PARTIES TO AGREEMENT

Iowa State University

By:

Kate Gregory
Senior Vice President

Date:

By:

Michael Newton
Assistant Vice President/Chief of Police

Date:

12



Prepared by Amy Beattie, City Attorney and reformatted by John Haldeman, City Administrator for the
Huxley City Council meeting to be held on the 13th day of February, 2018

ORDINANCE NO. - 476

AN ORDINANCE MAKING REVISIONS TO CHAPTER 62 OF
THE MUNICIPAL CODE OF THE CITY OF HUXLEY, IOWA TO
ADD STOP LIGHTS AS A GENERAL TRAFFIC REGULATION

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Huxley, lowa, is amending its
Municipal Code to add stop lights as a general traffic regulation.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the City Council of the City of
Huxley, lowa, as follows:

Section 1. Section 62.01, Violation of Regulations, is hereby amended by adding
Section 62.01(161) as follows:

161. Section 321.257 - Official Traffic Control Signal

Section 2. All ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict with the provisions of
this ordinance are hereby repealed.

Section 3. This ordinance shall be effective upon its passage, approval and
publication as provided by law.

PASSED and approved this day of 2018

Craig Henry, Mayor

ATTEST:

Jolene Lettow, City Clerk



Record Of Vote

First Reading

Roll Call
David Jensen
David Kuhn
Greg Mulder
Rick Peterson

Tracey Roberts

Second Reading
Roll Call

David Jensen
David Kuhn
Greg Mulder
Rick Peterson

Tracey Roberts

Third Reading

Aye

(Date)

Nay

(Date)

Aye

Nay

(Date)

Roll Call
David Jensen
David Kuhn
Greg Mulder
Rick Peterson

Tracey Roberts

Aye

Nay

Publication Date:

Absent

Absent

Absent



STATE OF IOWA
COUNTY OF STORY SS:
CITY OF HUXLEY

I, the undersigned, City Clerk of the City of Huxley, lowa, do hereby certify that
the attached is a true, correct and complete copy of all the records of the City Council of
the City relating to the adoption of an ordinance entitled “Ordinance No. 476 . An
Ordinance Amending Chapters 62 of the Huxley Municipal Code of Iowa.

WITNESS MY HAND this  day of , 2018.

Jolene Lettow, City Clerk



Prepared by John Haldeman, City Administrator, for the City Council meeting to be held on the 13th day of Febrnary, 2018.

RESOLUTION NO. 18-010

A RESOLUTION APPROVING DISPATCHING CONTRACT WITH
STORY COUNTY SHERIFF FOR FY 2019

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the City Council of Huxley, Iowa
hereby approves said copy of contract which is attached to this Resolution, and the Mayor
and City Clerk are authorized and directed to execute same on behalf of the City.
PASSED, ADOPTED AND APPROVED this __ day of February 2018.

Rol Call Aye Nay Absent
David Jensen
David Kuhn
Greg Mulder
Rick Peterson

Tracey Roberts

APPROVAL BY MAYOR

I hereby approve the foregoing Resolution No. 18-010 by affixing below my official
signature as Mayor of the City of Huxley, lowa, on this the __th day of February, 2018.

Craig D. Henry, Mayor

ATTEST:

Jolene Lettow, City Clerk




Sl EELY 2 EET L
Sherift's Office
Story County
PAUL H. FITZZGERALD, Sheriff

Emergency 911 « Office: 515-382-656€ « Fax #: 515-382-7479 - PO Box 265 - Nevada, lowa 50201

January 24, 2018

John Haldeman

Huxley City Administrator
City Hall

515 N. Main Avenue
Huxley, Iowa 50124

Dear Mr. Haldeman:

Enclosed you will find the Dispatching Services Contract for fiscal year 2019. As per the
contract, the increase 18 based on the Consumer Price index (CPI-U) Novermiber 2017 report
showing a 2.0% increase. The new FY19 per capita rate will increase to $5.87 for the City of
Huxley based on the 2010 Census population figures (4,144).

After your review and acceptance of the contract, please:
1. Sign the contract,
2. Affix the city seal,
3. Return the contract to my office no later than March 1, 2018.

I will sign and forward the contract to the Board of Supervisors for their signatures and see that it
is recorded with the Story County Recorder and the Secretary of State. Once it has been
recorded and we receive our copy we will forward a file stamped copy to you.

If you have any questions or concerns please feel free to contact me.

74

Smcerely,

; ﬂ1/

Paul H. F1tzgera1d, £
Story County Sheriff

Enclosure



Prepared by Paul H. Fitzgerald, Story County Sheriff, Nevada, Iowa 50201, 515-382-6566
DISPATCHING SERVICES CONTRACT

THIS AGREEMENT is entered into this day of , 2018, by and
between Story County, Iowa, and the City of Huxley, Iowa, and is duly authorized by Chapter
28E of the Code of Iowa.

The City of Huxley has no office wherein the police department may receive or dispatch
telephone and radio messages on a 24 hour per day basis. Huxley agrees to the following terms
with the Story County Sheriff’s Office:

1. This contractual agreement shall commence on the first day of July, 2018 and
shall continue for one (1) year ending on June 30, 2019. The per capita charge
shall automatically increase by 4 percent or an amount equal to the U.S,
Consumer Price Index for all Urban Consumers (CPI-U) for a 12 month period, to
be reviewed each November and increased the lesser amount. The new rate will
begin on the first day of each July.

2. Story County shall be reimbursed by Huxley for its dispatching services at a rate
of $5.87 per capita based on the 2010 census figure of 3,317 for Huxley and 827
for the City of Cambridge, combined population of 4,144, for an annual fee of
$24,325.28. This fee shall be paid in equal quarterly installments to the Story
County Sheriff’s Office on July 1, October 1, January 1 and April 1.

3. The Sheriff of Story County and his deputies or duly designated representatives
agree to receive in the Sheriff’s Office or county jail, such telephone calls,
teletype messages and radio messages as are directed to the Police Department
and the Fire Department of the Cities of Huxley and Cambridge and transmit the
same to the officers of the respective departments.

The Sheriff of Story County and his deputies or duly designated representatives
agree to receive or dispatch telephone, radio and teletype messages on a 24 hour
per day basis in the Sheriff’s Office or county jail as are directed to the Huxley
and Cambridge Wastewater Treatment Plant and transmit same to said
department.



Page 2

10.

11,

12.

The Sheriff‘s Office telephone number shall be included on the Automatic Dialing
Alarm System for the Water Department and Wastewater Treatment Plant.

The Sheriff or Sheriff’s Designee will provide the Huxley Police Department with
copies of teletype messages of general and specific interest to all law enforcement
officers and agencies in Story County.

The Sheriff or Sheriff’s Designee will provide a printed daily report to the Huxley
Police Chief or the Chief’s Designee of all phone calls received in the Dispatch
Center and other such calls for service and activities that are entered into the
Computer Aided Dispatch System for the Huxley Police Department.

The Sheriff agrees to provide and allow the Huxley Police Chief or Chief’s
Designee computer terminal access to the records contained in the Computer
Aided Dispatch System that pertain to the activities of the Huxley Police
Department and its officers.

The Story County Sheriff shall keep in the Story County Jail, under his control
and supervision, any and all prisoners who have been committed to its care by the
Chief of Police of the City of Huxley or his duly authorized agents or police
officers, for violation of the city ordinances of Huxley and Cambridge, Iowa, at no
additional charge.

The Sheriff and his deputies or duly designated representatives shall take
fingerprints and forward same of all persons arrested and brought into custody at
the Story County Jail by members of the Huxley Police Department to the Iowa
Division of Criminal Investigation and the Federal Bureau of Investigation as
required by Stale and Federal law.

The Sheriff agrees to allow the Huxley Police Chief or the Chief’s Designee
access to the criminal history and jail record files of all prisoners brought into
custody at the Story County Jail by members of the Huxley Police Department.

The City of Huxley agrees to pay all medical and doctor expenses for injuries to or
sickness of their prisoners held on City of Huxley and City of Cambridge
ordinance violations and all other extraordinary expenses related to those
prisoners which may occur and which are not due to the negligence of Story
County or its employees.

Story County will furnish and maintain the necessary radio equipment to provide
the services named above (The City of Huxley will pay for their telephone service
on the designated police department line installed in the Sheriff’s telephone
system.)

In accordance with Section 28E.7 of the Code of lIowa, this agreement shall not
relieve any of the parties hereto of any obligation or responsibility imposed upon
it or them by law, except that to the extent of actual and timely performance



Page 3

13.

14.

15.

16.

17.

18.

19.

thereof by either of the contracting parties hereto, said performance may be
offered in satisfaction of the obligation or responsibility.

No separate legal or administrative entity or organization shall be created by this
agreement; no separate budget shall be established and no tangible property shall
be acquired which would require disposition upon the termination of this agreement.

The duly elected Sheriff of Story County, lowa, and the duly appointed City
Administrator of Huxley, Iowa, shall be joint co-administrators of this agreement
as provided by Section 28E.6(1) of the Code of Iowa.

As joint co-administrators the duly elected Sheriff of Story County, Iowa and the
City Administrator, shall develop the necessary procedures to effectively
administer this agreement including but not limited to addressing new situations
not covered by this agreement and conflict resolution.

Story County shall file a copy of this agreement with the Secretary

of State and the County Auditor of Story County, lowa, and record a copy with the
Story County Recorder pursuant to Section 28E.8 of the Code of Iowa. The city
seal shall be affixed to the contract before returning to the county for filing.

This contract may be terminated by either party. Termination is effective at the
end of the current quarterly billing cycle and must be preceded with a minimum
30 day written notice to either party. Notice shall be accomplished by certified

mail or personal service.

Any amendments or addendums to this Agreement shall be created and passed in
the same manner and with reference made to this original document.

The initial term of the Agreement shall be automatically extended for successive
one-year periods upon the same terms and conditions provided by this Agreement
for the initial term, unless this Agreement is terminated or modified by the express
election of either City or County as hereinafter provided. Modification to this
Agreement may be made by mutual consent of both parties.

STORY COUNTY, IOWA, a political CITY OF HUXLEY, IOWA
subdivision of the State of lowa a municipal corporation

Story County Board of Supervisors Craig D. Henry

ATTEST:
Story County Auditor

Mayor, City of Huxley

John Haldeman

APPROVED: Huxley City Administrator

Paul H. Fitzgerald
Story County Sheriff



Prepared by John Haldeman, City Administrator, for the City of Huxley Council meeting to be held on the 13th day
of February, 2018

RESOLUTION NO. 18-012

RESOLUTION APPROVING THE FINAL PLAT FOR THE HELLAND
SUBDIVISION A MINOR SUBDIVISION — RURAL DEVELOPMENT WITHIN 2
MILES

WHEREAS, the Bierstedts of 3525 NE 166" Ave., Cambridge, Iowa and developer’s of
same, filed a minor subdivision Final Plat for one lot to be reviewed by the Polk County Planning and
Zoning; and

WHEREAS, this Final Plat lies within the 2 mile perimeter of the city of Huxley therefore it
must be approved by the City before it can be finalized with Polk County; and

WHEREAS, this final plat was received by the City on January 25, 2018 for its review; and

WHEREAS, this review request came to Huxley’s Zoning Administrator who reviewed the
plat as did the City’s Engineer and it is referred to the City Council with a favorable recommendation
from the Zoning Administrator and City Engineer.

BE IT RESOLVED, THEREFORE, that the Final Plat for the Wright Subdivision has
been submitted to the Huxley City Council and is approved.

PASSED, ADOPTED AND APPROVED this ____ day of February, 2018.

Roll Call Aye Nay Absent

David Jensen
David Kuhn
Greg Mulder
Rick Peterson
Tracey Roberts

APPROVAL BY MAYOR

I hereby approve the foregoing Resolution No. 18-012 by affixing below my official
signature as Mayor of the City of Huxley, lowa, this day of February 2018.

Craig D. Henry, Mayor
ATTEST:

Jolene Lettow, City Clerk




140§ iZavd  BE/RE/T G3LYQ W2EIGE4 Q0" I
EOwHgor gls Xud ke coras JNCHd
MO “ALNNOT SCd 005 MOl STy Z08 ALin5 1TTAS WLl 5 018

[ i )
€C-18-5 NDILD3S 40 p/T3Y 3HL NI QNU\H/\HHS GNV—I

NOISIAIGENS ANV T13H
1vId VNI SALVIDOSSY 3 OQHI’M'S)

102 “TE JEDEL B0 ST L36D THRBURS @-uRIIT A
F418 S1u0%00 Somv i AALr s M

NG JD B3 A 4G BARC DG sk A CaAuns pur) BT C00D
2oe s e, pur bnciaboara Telonn s b Sl e

il e 5 0w dpaine siaeiag s g Sedy A
PR P R P i et

G, gy
TN HE “‘.; .i;_
L a_;
H il
: »
! i
$ 5 i
& Bl
I i £
a5 £
: GO £
e g sgdy
™ Faal
fons

8 DFIvaLY EFULAC BYBLEW 4N A DB

H
B
£
Y

g
B
§

T T - .
1
1
) ; @ I ;
Cooz ul i

g2 . !

= d

= r

4 i

|

3 -
T i
apliag Sy 4
TR T T R W = ; 1oiE g S
: H ; e i
; 3 EE hgs d -
= |‘:,?s CA| [
By Fix l| igE"E LB
. B g L ]
gt waE E §i §
3 ) i%ﬁ ’ R
Bl . ' | 3
gi ' EE:& 2 | x
N . L4 ] =
E ] i | =
4 La 2
Sl —— :
. ]
& |
§i
- g woemng Y
f
{
gl
B
8 &
8 i
¢ i
® |
%FE A
BS iy B i N
ot TR R L oW




FINANCE



Prepared by John Haldeman, City Administrator for the City of Huxley, Iowa on the 13th day of February, 2018.

RESOLUTION NO. 18-007

RESOLUTION SETTING THE DATE FOR THE PUBLIC HEARING
ON THE PROPOSED FISCAL YEAR 2019 ANNUAL BUDGET FOR
FISCAL YEAR ENDING JUNE 30, 2019

WHEREAS, the lowa Legislature adopted legislation that mandates that a city shall prepare
and adopt a budget and shall certify taxes; and

WHEREAS, the Iowa Legislature requires each city to conduct a public hearing on the
proposed budget prior to adoption; and

WHEREAS, the Huxley City Council invites and welcomes the public to participate in the
budget process; and

WHERFEAS, the City Clerk shall publish the budget estimates and notice of hearing no less
than ten (10) days and no more than twenty (20) days prior to the date of the hearing.

WHEREAS, the detail budget must be made available for public review no less than ten (10)
days and no more than twenty (20) days prior to the date of the hearing.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF HUXLEY, IOWA,
that the Huxley City Council sets the date of March 6, 2018 at 6:00 p.m. for the public hearing on the
Proposed FY 2019 Budget and directs the City Clerk to prepare and publish notice of said hearing as
attached. The hearing shall take place in the Council Chambers in the City Hall.

PASSED AND APPROVED this day of February, 2018.

Section 1. Budget Summary: Levies |

FISCAL FISCAL FY 2019
YEAR 18 YEAR 19 DIFFERENCE
General Fund Taxable Valuation W/O G&E $ 70,079,068 | § 77,513,129 + 8 7.434,061.00
Debt Service Taxable Valuation W,0 G&E $ 152,314,136 | § 169,335,310 + §17,021,180.00
TYPE OF LEVY ACTUAL PROPOSED
ACTUAL PROPOSED FYI8 FY19
FY IS LEVY FYI9LEVY ESTIMATED ESTIMATED
AMOUNT AMOUNT REVENUES REVENUES
GENERAL FUND LEVY $ 8.10000 $ 8.10000 $  567.640.00 $  627,856.00
EMPLOYEE BENEFIT FUND LEVY $ 0.00000 $ 0.00000 $ 0,000.00 3 0,000.00
DEBT SERVICE FUND LEVY $ 3.75000 $ 3.75000 $ 571.178.00 $ 635,007.00
LIABILITY, PROPERTY, SELF-INS. $ 0.00000 $ 0.00000 $  00,000.00 $  00,000.00
TOTAL NON-AG PROPERTY TAX LEVY $ 11.85000 $ 11.85000 $ 1,140,880.00 $ 1,264,955.00
Ag Valuation 5 686,503.00 $ 69677200
AGRICULTURE LEVY 3 3.00375 $ 3.00375 & 2,062.00 $ 2,092.00




Section 2. Budget Summary: Programs
PROGRAM APPROPRIATIONS FOR ADOPTED APPROPRIATIONS PROPOSED APPROPRIATIONS
NUMBER FY 17 FOR FY 18 FOR FY 19
0 $ 3,203,314.00 $ 2,527,000.00 $ 2,514,278.00
1 $ 655710.00 $ 683,973.00 $  670,944.00
2 $  352,491.00 $  430,565.00 §  460,572.00
3 3 14,200.00 $ 16,255.00 3 15,000.00
4 §  608,696.00 $  492,650.00 $ 513,300.00
5 § 831207.00 $ 1,472,042.00 §  990,497.00
6 §  360,873.00 $  386,480.00 $  386,503.00
7 § 10,042,101.00 $ 2,356,043.00 $ 2312,194.00
g $ 1,184.989.00 $ 1,230,675.00 $ 1,333,047.00
$  000,000.00 $  000,000.00 $  000,000.00
$ 14,289,239.00 $ 9,595,653.00 $ 9,196,335.00
ADOPTED QPERATING BUDGET $ 9,595,653.00 $ 9,196,335.00
w/0 CIP
ADOPTED NET OPERATING $ 7,068,653.00 $ 6,682,057.00%
BUDGET*

*Does not include transfers,
Roll Call Aye Nay Absent
David Jensen
David Kuhn
Greg Mulder
Rick Peterson

Tracey Roberts

PASSED, ADOPTED AND APPROVED this day of February, 2018,

APPROVAL BY MAYOR

I hereby approve the foregoing Resolution No. 18-011 by affixing below my official signature as
Mayor of the City of Huxley, Iowa, this day of February, 2018.

Craig D. Henry, Mayor

ATTEST:

Jolene Lettow, City Clerk



Form 631.1

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING

BUDGET ESTIMATE

Depariment of Management

FISCAL YEAR BEGINNING JULY 1, 2018 - ENDING JUNE 30, 2019

lowa

City Hall

City of Huxley
The City Council will conduct a public hearing ¢n the proposed Budget at
on 03/06/2018 at 6:00pm
{Date) x/xxixx (hour)

The Budget Estimate Summary of proposed receipts and expenditures is shown below.
Copies of the the detailed proposed Budget may be obtained or viewed at the offices of the Mayor,

City Clerk, and at the Library.

The estimated Total tax levy rate per $1000 valuation on regular property

The estimated tax levy rate per $1000 valuation on Agricultural land is

11.85000

3.00242

At the public hearing, any resident or taxpayer may present objections to, or arguments in favor of, any part

of the proposed budget.

515-597-2561

Jolene R. Lettow

phone number City ClerivFinance Officer's NAME
Eudget FY | Re-estimated FY Actual FY
2019 2018 2017
(a) (b) {c)
Revenues & Other Financing Sources _
ITaxes Levied on Property 1 1,293,166} 1,140,880 1,081,234
lLess: Uncollected Property Taxes-Levy Year 2 - of 0 |
I Net Current Property Taxes 3 1,293,166 1,140,880{ 1,081,234
[Delinquent Property Taxes 4 0 1] G
TIF Revenues 5 2,617,542 2,854,800 2,189,812
Other City Taxes 6 575,607 540,674 559,696
Licenses & Parmits 7 100,700 47,600 201,129
[usa of Money and Property 8 16,500 40,200 52,004,
{intergovemmental 9 510,415 506,900] 963,476
Charges for Faes & Service 10f 1,746,817 1,603,000] 1,688,483]
Special Assessmenis 11 0] 0 1,015
Miscellaneous 12 31 ,OOOI 277,826 327,796
Other Financing Sources 13 of 0 6,896,997
Transfers In 14 2,514,278 2,527,0001 3,203,314
Total Revenues and Other Sources 15 9,406,025 9,538,880] 17,164,956
Expenditures & Other Financing Uses
Public Safety 16} 670,844 683,973 655,710
|Public Works 171 460,572 430,565 352,491
Health and Social Services 18] 15,000 16,225 14,200
Culture and Recreation 19} 513,300] 492,650] 608,696
Community and Economic Development 20 990,497 1,472,042 831,207|
General Government 21 386,503 386,480] 360,873]
Debt Sarvice 22 2,312,194 2,356,043 10,042,101
Capital Projecis 23 0 0 238,972
Total Government Activities Expenditures 24 5,349,010 5,837,978 13,104,250
IBusiness Type / Enterprises 25 1,333,047 1,230,675 1,184,289
Total ALL Expenditures 26, 6,682,057 7,068,653 14,289,239
Transfers Out 27| 2,514,278 2,527,000 3,203,314
Total ALL Expenditures/Transfers Out 28] 2,196,335; 9,595,653| 17,492,553
Excess Revenues & Other Sources Over
(UUnder) Expenditures/Transfers Qut 29| 208,690 -56,773 -327,597
Beginning Fund Balance July 1 30] 4,197,472 4,254 245 7,924,882
Ending Fund Balance June 30 31| 4,407 162 4,197,472 7,597,285




Aug-i0

Form 835.1 Popartmani of Monagsment

[ |
Adoption of Budget and Certification of City Taxes 8 5 8 1 6

FISCAL YEAR BEGINNING JULY 1, 2018 - ENDING JUNE 30, 2019 Resolution No.: 18-

The City of: Huxley County Name: STORY Date Budget Adopted:

(D™ Render

The below-signed cartifies Ihat the City Council, on the date slatzd above, lawfully approved the named rexslulion adopting & budge.! for nex! fiscal year, as summarized on (his ar-1 the supporting payas.
Attachad ls Leng Term Debi Schedule Form 703 which lists any and all of the debl sar-iss obligations of the City.

515-567-2561
Talapk: w5 NUTDEr S vme
County Auditor Date Stamp January 1, 2017 Property Valuations
With Gas & Electric Without Gas & Electric Las Offcla] Gansus
Regular in 78757421 = 77,513,129 a317
DEBT SERVICE aa 170,579,602 = 169,335,310 )
Ag Land an 696,772
TAXES LEVIED
2] B (c}
Code  Dollar Request with Property Taxes
Sec. Lirmit Purpose Utility Replacement Levied Rate
se41 810000  Regular General levy f 637,935 627,856 43 8.10000
[384) Non-Voted Other Permissible Levies
+26] 067700 Contract for use of Bridge ] 0 a4 0
12{¢10)  0.850CO Opr & Maint publicly owned Transit 7 = 0 45 0
12¢113  amnec  Reni, Ins. Maint of Civic Center _ 0 a€ 0
1202) oass00  Opr & Maint of City owned Civic Center ] = = 0 a7 1]
12{13)  0.06750 Planning a Sanitary Disposal Project 0 o 0 a8 0
1214 ozroca  Awviation Authority (under sec.330A.15) 1 1] 4% 0
12(15)  0.06750 Levee Impr. fund in special charter city 13 0 51 0
i2(17y Amines  Liability, properiy & self insurance costs 14 0 52 0
121y AamtNec  Support of a Local Emerg.Mgmt.Comm. 462 Q0 s 0
(384 Voted Other Permissible Levies
1201} 0.13600 InstrumentalMocal Music Groups 15 0 53 0
122)  0.81030 Memorial Building 8 ¥ 54 0
12(3)  0.A3¢00 Symphony Orchestra 17 1] 55 0
1244 ozrooo  Cultural & Scientific Facilities 18 a 66 0
125) Asvoted  County Bridge 19 - 0 57 0
12(8)  1.35000 Missi or Missouri River Bridge Const. 20 — 0 £q 0
12(8)  0.03375 Aid to a Transit Company 21 4] g 0
12(1€)  0.20500 Maintain Institution received by gift'devise 22— 0 o 0
t2{13)  1.00000 City Emergency Medical District a6 4] 488 0
2040} 0.27000 Support Public Library 23 0 [ 4]
206E22 150000 Unified Law Enforcement 24 — 0 & 0
Total General Fund Regular Levies (5 thru 24) 25 637,935 627,856
a1 300375 Agland 26 2,092 2,092 83 3.00242
Total General Fund Tax Levies (25 + 26) 27 640,027 629,048 | oconotasd |
Special Revenue Levies
3s43 027000 Emergency (if general fund at levy limit) 28 o 0 4 0
aes AmNec  Police & Fire Retirement 2 0 o
amiec  FICA & IPERS (if general fund at levy limit} 30 = 0 o
ru-s  AmiNes  Qther Employee Benefits 3 0 0
Tofal Employee Benefit Levies (29,30,31) a2 [¢] 0 65 0
Sub Total Special Ravenue Levies  (28+32) 33 0 0
Valuation
386 F8Req With Gas & Elec Without Gas & Elec
SSMID1T w [ - 34 0 &3 0
SSMID2Z w " 35 0 67 4]
SSMID3 [} - o 53 0 [t 1]
SSMID4 w @) 37 0 89 Qg
SSMID5 1 8] 65 4] 565 0
SSMID 8 ®) 556 1] 566 0
SSMID 7 4y ] 17 i] o 0
SSMIDB 1y ) 1188 0 e 0
Total Special Ravenue Levies <] Y] 0
c44 rmNec Debt Service Levy 76.10(6) 40 639,674 4 635,007 7 3.75000
347  0.67300 Capital Projects  (Capifal Improv. Reserve) It 4 0 n 0
Total Property Taxes (27+39+40+41) 42 1,279,701 42 1,264,955 72 11.85000

COUNTY AUDITOR - [ certify the budget is in compliance with ALL the following:
Budgets that DO NOT meet ALL the criteria below are not statutorily compliant & must be returried to the city for correction.

1) 7The prescribed Notics of Public Hearing Budget Estimate {Form 631.1) was kv Jully or poited If app fited procf was
Budget hearing notlcas v.era published or paled nal lecs then 10 day.. nor mare than 20 de 9, prior b the budgel haaring,

3) Adnpled properi; iaxss do noi excead publishe or posted amounts.

4) Adorted axpendilures do not exceed published or posted amounts In each of the nine-progrem areas, or In total.

5) Mumber of the resolullon adopting the budgel has baen included et the top of this form.

P} The budget file uploadsd i the SUBMIT Aran matuhed the paper copy certified by the ot 1o this office. v amly Auctior ]

7) The lang ierm drbt schedule {Form 703) shows sufficient payment amounts to pa;; the G.0. debi certified by the city 1o this office.




"Pela|tiloD aue SjesySIIoM TTY S0 AURMYOS o Aq Ul pojjy oue suopoas om) Bumiewas sy ..

1Mz ‘06 ANN JIGNT YYIA TVOSIH HOd INOJTY TVIONVNIA VMO 40 3UIVIS (2094 WHO4 Woy ueye aie (1) uopoes up saunfig ayy

29L'L0F'y 026'942'L Zre0EL'e lo | BT GBB'98. P 199°2LL'E 8,2'29E'2 0/8'G85"| 4} aouejeg pund Bupug
GEE'06L'6 FeS'zhs" | LLB'E08’. Io 0 SE6'vR0'Y LyL'0F6 2.8'208 261'G69'| b samnjipuadxz
GZ0'cor'e Liv'wLL'| BrS'LBY . lo 0 189v'vi¥'e Zre'il9'2 §10'028 £29'6E8') 0k sanusAay
TLP'LBL'Y L96'FGL'| g0s'ZY0'e lo 8.5'L¥8 lestoc) e- 99.'006"L gi0'sh¥'z PPSLEE L 6 alugjeg pung Buuuibag
6102 Ad 1ebpng .

lelo) puessy | Alejenndoig JAOD) O jusueuLIad foad yden AIDS )y3( ASY Ay Jodg |esauas) {£)

leoade 11

Ziv'iel'y L96'VSL L S0S'Zy0'e 0 8.5'L¥8 8SF'9EL'E- 99.°008"L SL0°Shr'2 7S L6E' L 8 soueleg pung Buipuz
j€S9's6S'8 5.9°884° | 846'008'/ 0 0 £0'EZR'E Z6Z'GZr' | 595'8/8 1920°089°L L sainjipuadxd 183-8y
088'RES'B 000°185') josg'/is6', 0 0 200'9.45 008'¥58°2 Z02'864'2 9148221 9 Sanusasy j53-
= rA T Zro'zoey | B4 0 | EYT) £8S°0L1 BSZ'LL 8.2'GZS 006'ZrE’L g soueeg pun Buluuibag
8102 Ad pajewns3-aoy .,

|e30] pueisy | Aejeudolg JADD) JO ] JusUeulad [oad 1den Al 1090 ADY Ay nadg |eldusg )

Jewadg _ Jil

GYZ'vSe'¥ ZPo'zoE’) 1€09'168'2 0 1845 L¥#8 £85'0L 1 86¢'L4 B8LZ'GES 906'2rE'L ¥ « (042 auy| ‘z) Bd) Qg aunr asugjeg pung Bujpug
£65'6E8'0Z B8F'SPE’L |ro1'06v'5L 0 |z:6%ecz L7l 'GBEEL Y RLS'E L8P LY 990'918°2 £ «l65Z aull ‘zL Bd) |eg pug ydeox3 seumypuedx3 |enjay
9g6'v9l'2L  |evl'z1eL  [eisuv9st o loss5vzz iv2'P60'01L  [ZL8'¥6S'Z £l 118'G1€°2 z « (ze1 9uil g Bd) jeq Bag 1deoxg sanuessy |ENloy
788'vZ6'L 886'061 'L vEB'EEL'D 0 |oss'sss £/B'00%'S 068'%S av0'6.5 LOL'ER8') b «{rE} 3ull ‘g Bd) | A soujeg pung BuwuBeg
1102 Ad Hoday jenuuy,

(r) () (H} (2) () {a) (o) {a) {v) {1)

jejot Aejoudold | juswinianog | jusueuusy foag yden AIBg )30 A9y [edadg ADY |eIoadg|  |essuaD)
pueisy e10) 4L
AaxnH 10 A1) Joy JesysHopM 3oUBlEg PUny
yuewafieuey jo Juewpedag

Mg wiog



{989'809 059'Z6Y 0 7 059'26Y Ise {28 - 1 souy) TVIOL
0 008'2 nog'L i UONESIDSY PUE AIMND JBYIO
91Z'¢ 0 _mm BULBW % ‘007 ‘J8jus) Aunuwo
0 002 002 fee Ajewsan
198012 orovoe 0t0'70Z e uoleainay
LOL'BLL fosi'ss loss’ss 33 ed
0 Io Fas J8Jealy] pue pueg ‘wnasnpy
2L6'GLZ loceisl 0€8°'L6L LE sadalag Aeign

NOILLYIHI3Y ® JHNLIND

002'¥) GEZ'OL [t] [¢] GZZ 9L 0g (62 - £2 seu) IW.LOL
000' GECT'¥ Gz Y _mN S32IAJBSG [BIDOG pUE YlesH Jaul0
0 o Isz e [Bjuapy Aunwwon
00Z'LL 000'ZL 000'Z1 2z |loguo) oynbsop pue ‘iny “Jejean
0 a | [} uopoadsu] pue uopenBay eaH
0 0 fsz s|eydso sjeald o} siuawifed
0 Jo vz [exdsop Ao
0 Io lez SoUBISISSY BJejla M

S3JIAMIS TVID0S B HLTV3H

L6¥ Z5E GOG'0Cy 0 G00'09¢E 00S'+9 [44 (12 -Zi saip) 79101
0 lo | 4 SHOM Slfand J8yi0
lozgee 00S0F Joos‘or 0z (esudsajug you yj — abeqien
0 0 | {asudiajuz jou j1) Hodlly
Ziv'L 0BL'EL 08L°EL Is1 Bues|] 19813
0 0 | ~_Buuassuibug AemyBiH
LOL'LL 0L8'EL 0lS'EL 9F |EAOLLSY MOoug
7oz L 005'2 005'L Gl Ajajeg pue jojuon ager |
89E'CE 000'St 000‘L2 00072 ¥l Bupub] 1e2as
0 0 £l 19955-J0O pue Jajely - Buplieq
926'59Z 518°0LE IsL8'0ig Zl sylemapis 9 ‘sebpug ‘speoy

SMUOM J17aNnd

[012°59 £L6'E89 0 0 £.6'€89 i {04 - ¢ sau) T¥10L
lo 0LS oLg oL Aajes alignd YO
feco'z 008'L Joos't Is |94UOT [elIUY
fo 0 15 $80|AI8S BA[D3]0.d SNoaUe|RoSIy
lo [t} I suonoadsuy| buiping
vLl'LE) 0SE'LEL 0se'ZEL le asugnNquiy
GO6'6S 109'L8 Lo Le G juswpedsq a4
0 0 ¥ [0[U07) pood
88G°Z) 0 Ie Juswabeuey Louablalug
i 0 14 Her
086'cSY Z1L29r Z1.'2op L uouasald awuDauswpedar] edjog

ALIJVYS JiTand
) ir { (H) (o) ) Q) {a) (2) ) v
102 8Lo0Z AHY1II4dOodd | LININVIANId | SLOArOdd JJIAH3S SANNIATY ANNIAIY IVHIANID SALLIAILOY LNJANNMIAOD
IvNLovY Q3IVRHNILLSS-3Y IVLdYD 1434 IVIOadS AVIOAdS
dl.L
siea, jeosiy gloe Buipuz seap |eosid QILVNILSI-TY
I 39Vd 3TNAIHOS STUNLIANIIXI QILVNILSI-TH
swaweBguel Jo wewpedag >0_x=—.— H_o t_o 1d 3 LED wuoy



"SNOILONYELSNI 338 "dY3A TVNLOY 3HL HUM NI SNOLLYINdOHddY SNINNILNOD
“HYAA WNLOV 3HL OL HOIdd ¥Y3A ¥ HOH 38 LON N¥D NOLLYIHAOHAdY ONINNILNCD IHL "ALIHOHLNY ONIANIAS IHL NIYLE0 01 1350N4 SHVIA SNOIAIYd ¥ NO a3dY3ddy IAVH LSNIN
L23r04d WIdYD FHL 40 LNNOWY TYNISIHO JHL HAAIMOH "LNIWANIWY NY IHINDIY LON 00 STuNLANIIXT HONS "ASVLNNTOA S NOLLYTHAOYDDY ONINNILNOD IHL 40 35N IHL

582" 685" 4 ZiV'IBL'Y _.Bm_vmi 0 | ETEIET] 8SF'9ELE- lo9:'005"L | E Irvctiee’s 6.4 OE sunf aduejeg pund Buipul
ECS'ZEE'LL £59'GES'8 fi 0 EPO'EZR'E _Nmm_mmv__, G9G'BL8 8.0'089°} 8L {ps+€s SOUN) S950 Wi JOYIQ PUE seunyipuadx (BIOL
¥ IE'E0C'E 000'228'2 DOD'8SS a 0 000°297'L 0 000'205 0 Ll g siggsuel] Ty {ejol
o006t 0 | 0l INQ Siajsuel] ueo JiL [Ewsly|
A 000'225'2 §000'855 000°29%'L 000'Z0S Gl IO sisysues] Jenbay
6£2'68Z'V| €58'800°/ 629'062'L 0 0 __leyo'ase's ceT St L 596'0/¢ 820°089'L L (p/+8G sau] SIUNLIGNIEXS 1TV TVIQL
B6BETEL'L 5/8'0EZ'% 5/9'082"| |64 (89 - 95 seuy} SIUNLIANIIXE IdAL SSANISNE TV.LOL
o] 0 (43 $103rodd TvldvyDd dil esudisu3z
0 | ke S.L03r0xd TvlidvD sspdisjug
BOY'897 06" 022 J06¥'022 04 IDNAYAS L1830 sspdiajuy
02e'72 0 l69 (918 "Bupyied "Jg) “dsoy Aio) 2dA) sssulsig BUIQ
0 0 lea Runr ey Wars
0 o 9 Auoyiny bujsnoH
0 0 99 auoydajeL R 19U "AL 9|q€D
0 0 9 BSUE ]
- - 79 abeqienqupue]
0 0 £9 Hodury
0 0 29 Ajnn sen
2 0 L9 Apn 21993
IE4°EBE 048'92% joi8'92Z5 09 Aipn Jamag
vZ50LS cleeer fsicesr 65 Auinn Jsiepm
481 pe1ebpng @ sspdiayu3 :Kiejajidosd
S3ALLIALLDY 3dAL SSINISNE
0SZ'¥OLEL 0.6'288'C 0 0 CF0'95E' st gerad G85°9.€ 820°089°} 85 (POHEG+ECH+HPF+RE+0E+ZT+E 4 SOUH)
Semj|puadxy SeRANOY [BJLUBLILIBACS TWLIOL
Z16'0ET | [ 0 0 0 0 0 L6 S103ro¥dd VLAY IVI0)
0 Jo 95 spaloid [eydeg JiL
CLE'8ET Io 55 sj09l014 (euden Aog
L0L'2F0'0¢ £Q'93E'T CP0'9GE°T PG J2IAM3S 1830
£48'09¢ 08F'98e 0 000'€ 00S'0L 086'2.E [} (G - 9 seuyl) TWIOL
SEL'L 0o0'g 000'S 44 JUBLULLBAQL) jBlaUas) JBLIG
0 0 LG Aungert poL
ByE'S0L GCLVEL cZi'vel 05 sBuip|ing Jeisuag 7 [IEH A1D
516'FE 005'6E 005'6€ 6 Aowopny Ao @ seoweg eBa
0 00g't : 00g'e i suonos3
180102 GIB'Z0Z 000 20501 S/7'681 Iy “WRY @ouBUld g Jaunseal] WS
06121 08401 084'0L ot 1abeuely A0 g IOUN0T JoAEw
LNIWNYUIAOD TYHINID
L0Z'1ER ZF0'ZLp’) 0 Z6zEer | 2 0SL'6F St {rr - 6€ s9UlY) TYLOL _
|

Lad A 0 CF JuawdcAaQ] Ucsg R WeD JBUIQ
809261 000'GE 000°SE v Buiuoz g Buiuuelg
0 . (54 |emausy ueqJn pue Bujsnoy
PS5y 26T 9Er' L Z62 cetr' L 000'F1L o Wswdopaaq olWoucay
0 054 0G5. i T uopesineag Aunwiios

ININDOTIAIA JINONCIT ® ALINNWINOD

O} T3] [0} {H} (9) (2) [E] {a) (&) (a} (v}
LL0Z BLOT AHVIIIddOdd LININVINEAd §103aroud 2DIAYTS SANNIATY SANNIATY IVEINTID "
IVNLOY GaLYNILST-3IH Tvlid¥D 19340 IVIo3dS IVIS3dS 1NOD S3ILALLOY INIWNYIAOCO
1L
SIE9A [29314 glLoez Buipu3 Jes, jeos|d Q3LVvINILST-3H

wawabieuey o weupedsq

€ 39Vd 3TNAIHIS SFUNLIANIAXT QILVWILSI-TY

As|xnH

40 ALID

Td 3 1£9 uiog



_mmm_%o.mm SZL'E6L'E) fero'erez o | S G95°989 850'026'2 |ora'cze's 220°LL0'C [s¥ v 3gNYIVE NIDZE ' SINNIASY TVIOL
ZBR'YEE L AT J219'z9¢"L a | ETENRL] £96'0LE EErAT | EYFAFEL] 906'2rE" L (12 L Anf sougieg pund Bupuitag
|osavoL 2i 088°8EG'6 000'L85"} 0 C 200'9.9 008'¥S8'E ZOE'86L' OL1'BEL'L %4 (65 % 'SE ¥¢ CF 6L P4 €L ZL G ¥ 'L saul)
aalejeq puny BupuuiBaq Jo) Jdeaxs Sanuessy Rj0 L
11200L°0F 0oD'228'T 000'22e ] o] 0 0 000'€08°L 000205 [44 foe ~up g2 seu) sa0uN0g Bujouruly Jayip-jejoigng
0£9'¥8 0 N4 S8|Eg 1988y [BYdED JO Spaatid
£2€'ZL9'9 Io Ob_UIMOLOR jetiajuf i Bupniox3] 19e( I6 $padoig
PLE'E0E'E 000425’ 000'2E2 0 o 0 0 000'E08"L 000°ZLS —ymm ) slajsued ] Bupesad( 71y ie3oqng
00054 L 0 ge U] SISUBI  UBOT 4|1 [euia)
PLE'BYE L 000'£25'T loo‘zee 000'E08'L 000'205 LE up sigjsuel) Bunessdg i2nBay
:580.n05 BuloueLl S0
95L'L € DZR LIZ _mam_mm_. o' 6L L 9t mggﬂ_gw_i
510’} 0 IsE_ SRIBUISSasSY |eloads
| EEEEEETY 0C0'E09'L 000°BSE | 0 0 i 0 000’72 L3 (€€ Ny} 12 sauy) eowmieg 1o sebieyD - [BJ0IGNS
0gg8'LoE 000'+iE 000'++2 £ eoiag Jo; safiieys g sead BUIO
0 0 43 A Bjep wiols
o 3 T3 Auouyiny BuisnoH
[i 0 [ auoydsjel @ jeuwselll ‘A 9iqeD
0 0 |6C Hsuel|
o 0 [ Jeudsop
B 0 12 abeqieg/ypue)
0 0 {8z uodJjy
o 0 | 74 Bunjeg
0 0 | 4 Aunn seg5
0 o Iez A dugoelg
B S04 00G" 068 000'069 fez lamag
G9L'089 000°599 000’689 ¥4 TR =TT
‘INNPE g 5884 o) saBisyn
9.¥'EQE 006805 D 0 0 0 0G0 0gY 006'93 02 {61 nayp g1 sew) [EBWLISAOE.) - [EJ0ING
6ER'DEE 009'GL 009’52 6} SjUBIBSINGLIIY B SIURIS [2I07
L26'9¥ 0CE'} L 00E'}1 1] SISWASINGUISY § SIUB.D SIBIS B0
VBL LI 000'0Z} 000'0ZY A SAXE] 95 peoy
92u'LLL Q 9l SjUaWesINqu|ay § SILEIS) [BJapad
‘|BBWLIBADBIBI|
| LatlolA) 00Z'DF ooz or gL Auadold 9 Asuow Jo asf)
BZL'1L0Z 0092y 008'L¥ ¥ Sjie d @ sesuean
959'65S $49'0pG ur 128y 000" 11 058'8) L el {21 nap g seuy) sexe) AjD JeyiQ - [EjoIGNg
1S0'FEY 000'2L¥ 00021 b {z4 saxe| UojdQ (eSO JAYD
o D | M S6XE L BIOW/RIOH
204'S 00L'2 DOL'Z _o_. SSXE ) SWoH BNgo
° 0 16 X} Jobem Bujles)
0 i] Is XE] Jabem pnnweq
520'00) 05201 052701 12 (2°¥3¢€ 4oty apag esol)  XE) BSIDUBY AN
3L6'6L Z8'0l yee'y looo'zL b sexe] @310xg Jaweoedey xe L AN
L saxe L A 0
|lzLe'6al’s __looa'vse'z 008 ¥S8'T H SANUANAY <11
0 0 | N saxe| Apedold janbuyaq
¥ET'L80'L 088°0F L") 0 | TS 0 204'695 £ (2 ouf snupyr | s} sexs| Auedald wanng 18N
0] 0 | 3 189 ), Aner - sexe ] Aiado.d pejos||ooup 8887
vee 190'L 0B 0wl L BZ)'128 1z67'698 r Auedald uo pajne sexel
$33UNOS DNIINYNI4 HIHLO 7 SINNIAIN
o1 ir} (] H) ©) () (€] (a (2
oz 810z AYY1IHdOYd 1NINvIWHId S103roud AJIAY3S SANNIASH SANNIAIY AYHINZD
NLOY Q3LVHNILST-IH IVidvS 1934 IVID3dS YI3ds
1L

SIBa A |eosi4

(usweleuep Jo JueWpERdar]

18174

1V13a S3NN3IATY QILVAILSI-TYH

Bulpu3 1es A |e9s1d QI LVWILS3-TH

Aopxny

40 ALID

Qe wiey



069'809 059'Z8Y 00E'€LS 0 00£'ELS gt (Z€ - 1€ seuy) 1wiOL
0 00g'L” 0062 0062 £ uonEalsay pUB BININD BUI0
01z’ 0 0 of BUUEW ¥ ‘007 '19JUa7) AJIUNLULIOY)
0 002 0 T Nalawan
188012 0rP0'P0Z 125081 125081 | O uofeaiday
LOL'BLL 08288 6vZ'all 62 041 £e syed
4] [43 3] ZE lajeay] pue pueg ‘wnasnpy
818'GiZ 0£8' 161 089'80Z 0E9°80Z X3 saoineg Aieigr]
NOILLYIND3N B JANLIND
002’1 6zz'gl 000G ) ] 000°GL 0g {6z - £Z seuy) TY.10L
000°g GZT P 0008 000°¢ 62 SAUNIBS [RINOG PUE YHEdH B0
0 0 0 8z Y)saH [Bjuspy Auunwiwiony
00z L1 000'z1 0002k 000'Z1 2 [24U03 SNrbsop pue Uy JBIEAM
4] i) 0 oz uoiadsu) pue uojgnbay yjesH
0 0 o Gz sjeyjdsoy sleaugd 9} sjuswied
0 0 0 ¥z [EndsoH Ao
0 0 c [d S0UEISISSY aIB}ap
S3DIANIS TVIDOS ® HLTVIH
L6268 G4 0EY Z18'09% 2/8'00F 00465 (%4 {12 - 21 seul} T¥L0L
0 D 0 K SHIoM JGNd BUD
0.£'€E 00507 004'GE 002°SE 0Z (osudrejuz jou gy obeqreg
0 0 0 6l (esudsauz jou 4iJ Hodary
Ziv'L 08LEL G5Z'ZL GGZCh Is1L Buiues|D 19848
0 0 0 m BupaauiBug femubly
JOL'k) 0LGEL e6E'S) Z6E°GL 9L |EAGLLZY MOUS
792" 0052 00S'sL 005°2 Gl Ajejeg pue [oquog eIl
85L'sE 000'SY 000'g8 000728 000'v2 | i Bupybr] 1eans
0 [ 0 gl 193410 pue Jajap - Bupped
0Z6'592 GLE'0LE GZL'CEE GZLESE zZl Si|emapIs g "sebpug ‘speoy
SHYOM DI7and
014659 £.6'E89 Fr6'049 ] Fr6'0L9 L {04 - & Souw) IWI0L
0 0L oo8 098 0l fejeg aignd Jayio
£E0°'2 ocg'y 008°L DOR°F B |0JUDY) [BUUY
0 ] 0 £l SA0AIRS BAlJ0SI014 SNOBUR||2ISIN
0 0 0 n suonasdsu| Buippng
Ll L2 DSE'LEL £45°G6 €566 9 BouEINqUY
G96'65 109'L8 9808 o898 g yawipeda( a4
0 0 0 12 lonuo) poojd
98571 0 0 £ —:wEmmmcm—a >ucm9vEm
0 0 0 Z ller
0S6'EGY Z1L'Z90 A G2Z'osy 1 LCRUaARL awnpAuaupedsag 9910d
Al3dVS JNgnd
8] ) 1) W [m)] )] () @ @ o) @ 7]
210z 810z 6L0Z ANVYLIINdONd LNINVINNTL S103roud ADIANES SANNIATY SANNIATY AYYIANID S3AILIAILOY LNJWNJIAOD
IvnLavY QaLVINILSS-3Y 132an8 IVLIdYD lg3a IVID3dS WVIDAdS
diL
siesa) |eosi 6L0Z Bulpugaeap |eosiq
I 39vd ITNAIHIS SFUNLIANISX3
wawaBeuep jo waupedeq hﬂ—*:—-— bV 80 W04

d0 ALID



"ASN J0d SNOLLONHLSNI 338 pasn J) suuo} 1s6png auy Ausdwosae jsnw ey abed sdoaddy upo ey uo Spew s Agua ey yasicsd [eydeo s es4 Joud e woy Junclue peyebpng pepuadeun sy 5) ucpeudoidde Bujnupues v ,

wawebeuey: jo wawpedag

¢ 39Vd ITNAIHOS STAUNLIANIdX3I

Ae|xnH 40 ALID

GRZ'16S'L Ziv'LEL'Y 291 LOV'Y fozs'azz'L 0 8.6 L8 8698 v __‘wm_ht_m _m_.N_Nmm.N _o._.m.mmm__. 6.4 0 sunr asuejeg pundg m_.___u:m
£9G'Z6P' .| £59'G65'6 SEC'06)'6 PZSZBS | 0 0 566'700'Y L¥L'0P6 ZL8'E0E 261'C0O° L gL (a+se 7o) Iy SISJSURLY PUnd g Saunjipuadxs (B30
¥IE'€0Z'E 000°L25'2 18L2'vL5'2 LLV'BSZ 0 o LOB'ZSL ) 0 000'20% 0 1L MO sIsuell TV [B10L
000'pS8'L ° 0 0 N INO SJajsuel | JuslwAeday 7 UBDT 41 [BUISIL]
FLE'GYT | 000'225°Z 9.Z'%L5'Z L1¥'6S8T LOB'ZSL'S 000205 SI INQ sJaysue ] Jenbey
6EZ'68Z' VL £69'690'2 £60'289'9 P0E2E’} o 0 ¥BL'ZLE'Z 1pL'0vE 248'00% 261'568') 12 (p£+8G Seu} SIUNLIONILXS 1T¥ TVLOL
686'¥8L'L G£0'0E2' L £p0'ECE"L LPO'EEE | £ (22 - 69 souyy) seunppuadxg adA) sseuisng Ty 101
0 0 0 43 $.03roYd vlidyo dIL 9sudieuy
0 0 i L $103rodd TvLidvD esudieg
80892 DBY 022 0 19 0L IDIAHIS Lg3q  asudiea
02£°Z2 o 0 69 (-1 ‘Buiyled '4g| “dsoy o) edA1 scauiEng Jaic
0 0 0 Is9 AN 1eepm uog
0 0 0 19 Auoypny Busnoy
0 0 0 99 auoyde|a] g Jeuisiu| ‘Al BjgeD
0 0 [ EE] HsuBlL
0 0 [ ) abeqiesy||pue]
0 0 o £9 Yodiny
0 8 0 z9 Auinn se9
[ 0 0 19 Aumn awmoeg
1€2'C8E 0.8'9e8 L85°0L9 L£6°0.9 09 ANnn Jameg
YZS'0LS SILE'E8Y 015'¢99 015290 65 ETHEEEN
481 pa1ebpng ¢ ssudiauy Aiejyeudosg
SALLIAILOY 3dAL SSANISNG
0SZvOL'EL B8.6°/E8'S 0LG'6YE'S 0 0 P6L'ZLE'T L2 0v6 Z.8'00F L6169l BS ({G+PG+EG+OP+@E+0C+ZE+L L Souf)
saIn}ipuadxy S81JIAIIOY JUSWILIBA0S TVLO0L
2.6'85Z 0 9 0 0 a 0 0 45 S103rodd TvLdvD T¥.LOL
0 fl 0 los spaloid |8yded J1L
7L6'BEZ 0 0 55 s10al0.g [ENdED AOS
L01'2¢0'0) £t0'05E'2 v6L'ZIE'T WaL'ZIE S JOIAM3S 18340
{EL8'00¢E 081988 E05'98¢E 18] 1] 0 £05'98¢ 125 {20 - 9p soun) WIOL
SEL'L 000'S 000'G 000G 25 JUBLILIBADS) [BIGUDS) JBUIO
s . 0 s TERLETY
SE'SO L SZL'YEL Bvb'ZZl SFF'ZZL [0 sBuipjing [essuas) ' iIEH AUD
6LS'PE 009°6E 00S°EY 00S'EF 14 Aeuiopy MG g seoieg [efo
0 Joos’e 0 i sucgae|3
180°'L0Z G.6°Z0Z SP0°S02 SPO'S0Z i ‘WY 8JuBU|{ @ 'Jainseal| §alD
06121 08.°0L DLSOL CLS'0) af JaBeuew AuD g 1Iounod ickely
ANFANHIAQD TVHINTD
L0Z'LER Zr0'ziy') 161 (66 0 I 0 052'G Ha (¥ - 6¢ Seuy) WLOL
| Ldd
adas] 0 0 =3 Wawdosaag uass g WoD B8R0
60926} 000'5e 000'GE 000'SE M4 Buwioz g Buuueld
0 0 0 e |emauay ueqn pue Buisnoy
PSL'pL £BZ'9Ev’L LPL'VG6 L¥L'0PE 000'¥L Ot yawdoeasq iloucog
[+] 0G4 0G4 0SL GE uojjeapineag Aununuon
LNIINdCITAZA JINWONODT ? ALINNININOD
(3)] 1) {r} W (H) (9} ()] [EX (a} [&)] (@ v}
L1407 810z 6102 AUVIARAONd| LINSNYWNEd | S1O3roud | FDIAMAS | SINNSAIY | SINNTAZM | Twnanas "LNOD SILLIAILOVY LNIJWNHIAOD
LY TaLvYWILS3-au 139ang Wiidvd l93da IYI0zIdS AVIDIdS
dil.
siea) |easly 6102 Buipu3 seep |easiy

2d v liguucy



8£8'G20'SE I L6V E00'EL | TR 0 | ST 086'+24- Jooeel 'y |oso'sez’e | A | fonzraa 4 IQNVIVE NIDIG ¥ SINNIAIH TV.LOL
Z8R'VE6 L FA A ZLYiBL Y 186'¥517) 0 | EFCRR T 9E1'OE ) E- §9.'005'L [8i0Gkv'E | ﬂ.v | AlInf soUejeg pund Bujuu
956'¥9L'LL 088'9E5'6 GZ0'90%'6 Liv'pLL') 0 0 B3 VIY'E ZFSLIST 510°028 £25'6E9") (4 {i¥ B ‘9€ 'SE ‘#€ '0Z S} ‘FL €L T ¥ T seuwyp)

: saue|eq puny Bujuuibeq Joy ydeoxe senuassy |e3o)
LLE'00L Dk 000°£25°2 Jgiz'vise 1 1p'852 0 D LOB'ZEL'L 0 0 000208 3 for i g¢ seu)) sasunog Buisueuld sayio-ieiolgng
0:9'v8 0 ¥ SB|ES 1958Y [EYJET) JO Spsdoig
LZEELE'Y o T oy _(Bliwog jawsaiu) 1.4 Buipnoxs) yieq 10 spesdnid
FLE'ECZ'E 000'225C BLZF15'C 1LY 652 o 0 LO8'ZEL L [ 0 000'20% 5E | sJgysuil) Bupeiadp TY [R10Jang
000 ¥S6°L 0 [o BE U| SJ9jSuBl] UBOT 4|1 [BURS|

frieare’L 0007276 ezz'vise 1¥'652 Jroszesy 00205 I3 ul sigjsuel] BupessdQ teinbey
's80.n0g Bupusu Jey0
96."L2€E 978'1.1Z 000'LE 000°LE [T STOGUE) OIS
510°) 4] 0 SE SJUBWSEassY [elads
_mmv.wwm; 000'€09'L 218902} 00G'SSY'L 0 0 0 0 L1E1LET e [eg nafy 1z saun} exaeg soy sabueys - BIOIGNG
0S8'LOE 000'F¥E £19°L62 218" 162 e aojaleg o) safileyn g sead BUIQ
[ 0 0 Jes fimn e uLols
0 0 o |53 Ruoyny Biijsnoy
0 o 0 0E slioydele | § 1eudju| AL 9D
\] 0 n 4 USUBI|
o 0 0 82 [eydsoH
0 0 0 iz abeq.en/jjypue
] 0 0 o2 podiy
0 0 0 cz BupEg
0 [ 0 3 Ayn se
0 [} 0 £z An supeg
82'30L 000'069 000'GEL 000°SEL 44 A0 lemeg
582'089 000'699 00002 00002 1z Ainn =em
“mu—_?_mm B sea4 o) wwmnmr_o
941'€96 006'905 SL'0LS 0 0 4] 0 S10'€0F 00t 201 174 (61 ) g4 sauy) IRuaILIBACER] - [EI0)GNS
6E£8'02E 008'SL 000'20L 00Q'203 6f SRBWEsINGUIBY ' SIUEID) |ea0T
126'9¥ 00E'LL 00¥'S 0 0 i 0 0 00t'c B SjuBWesINquiay g SIUIS ajElS BUI0
2L L LY C00'0ZF SLO'E0P GLO0'E0F 4} $6Xe 950 PEOY
926'L4) 0 0 9 SjueLWesNqUWIdY B SIS [Biepeg
(BB WwBAcBIeN|
¥00'28 00Z°0¥ 00S'gl 00501 7 Apedald g AUCIA JO BS)
€Z)'10Z 008'L¥ 004'004 004001 ¥i Sjiuiad B SISUII
w69 55S v49'0¥5 L09'S.G 0 299" 000'4 L7 CFG'ES) <€l {Z1 nayy 9 seuy) saxe) A0 BYIO - [BI0IGNS
GO HE 000" L 00021t 000'zLY 43 Saxe] uofdo jea07 JAN0
0 0 0 L SEXE | RIOW/RIOH
T0L'S 00L'E LOB'E 198t 0L Sexe] eloH JIqop
0 0 0 6 xe) Jobem Bulwesy
0 0 0 18 e} Jabem pRinwped
S20'0G1L DSL'FOL D000 L 000°'0r1 L (zrocepdeyg ipog emoy)  x@) asiucuey AN
81681 Irza'ol opL'yl ol oo’y 0 62001 ] SexB] BSI0XT uslwaseday Xe L ANuN
=axe) Ayg syl
ZL8'68L'C 008'¥59'Z Z7G2La'E lzrs'2102 S SenueAay Jj)
0 Jm 0 | _v sexe ] Apedold uenbujieg
¥EE' 1201 088'0vL’L ﬁmv.mmmk_. 0 000259 o | ) £ {z euy snunw ;. au) sexe) Apedold weuns 18N
0 0 | 4 1eep fas - sexe] Mpedoud pejosjjooun) 583
PEC'1L80'L 028'0FL'L feci'esgy o L00'2G59 0 N l Ap8dolg Lo paiAeT SEXE[
S3AJUNOS DSNIINYNIJ ¥IHLO B SINNIAIH
o []] {r} [} (H) Y] ("] (a) (a 2 (a) {v)
2102 810z BLOZ AUV1IIINAOYd | LININVWHI S123roNd ITMAMAS SANNIATY SANNIAIY Tvd3INID
IvOLDY QILVIILSI-T™ i3sana IvLidvD Llg3a IVIDAdS WIDAdS
JIL
Siea ) [eosiq 6L0Z Bulpuz Jea, |easi4
paje|dwon ale swioy 1s3-ay Ay |=<._.mn_ WW=ZN>WM
BIUO Ul 1Y {Im SULUNJCD OM) JSB| Y|
1uswaBeuep Jo jusuydsg >°—K—.— —l— Lo t_ u g 189 uuny



S8Z'165°L ZL'i8L'Y 2oL'20%'y lozs'asz'L Io 845°L18 G96'08.L - [Los'zil'e 8LZ'29L'Z Jors'seg'L ¥E OE Sun[ sJuejeq puny Buipug
288°'vz6'L  JovZ ey Ziv'16L'Y _mmm.vm L'} lo 845" ¥ 8av'9eL'e-  99/°005°L S.0'Srb'E pys'Lee’L EE 1 Anr a3uejeg puny BujuuiBeg
168G L2¢E- £4.°95- 069602 _mmm. LZL 0 {0 125069 |- G62'9.9'L 168°Z8- 9z rrL ze IO SIBJSUBL]/SeaN)PLBTXT (IBpUTY)
X JOAQ SONOG JBLLD B SENLSATY SS80XT]
less'zar'LL £59'G65°6 JSEE"961'6 frzs'ees’| | 0 S66'790'y L7075 Z18'208 /61'G69°L o€ QO sieysuel| pundssamypusdxg Ty (00
frig'eoze 000°£25'2 [2iz'vi5T J:iv'652 0 0 108°26.°L fi 000'20S 0 BT ING 5i9jSUBIL €101
BEZ'6@2 vl [£59'890°2 $0'CEE"L 0 0 VEL'ZLE'Z /9. 0B Z.8'00F 161'G69'L 82z Sa.njjpuedig edAy $ng g ACD (2101
686'P8L'L G/9'0EZ') i ¥0'EEE" L iZ 451 ¢ asbdieu3 :Aefeudold adi) sseuisng
0SZ'v0L'el 2.16'JE8'G 0L0'6VE'S {0 [a 61L'2LEZ L72'0v6 248°001 L6 'GBY' | 9z S2NYPUBUXT SSIALIY JUIWUIBAOS [B10L
T.6'8e2 0 0 [o] o] : 0 0 J_m cZ soelod [eydes
LOL'ZF0'0L EP0'9SE 2 PELZIE' D PELZLEZ 0 0 0 e 8RS g
£48°'09€ 08y'98e £05'98¢ [} 0 0 £05°08¢ €z TUBLILLBADE) [EJIBE)
FRARE] ZrPO'ZLP') |i6¥'066 G Lp2'0¥6 0 0S4'6¥% TC JUawdojaAag JNUCLIGOT, Pug AJUNWWAGT
960'809 0GY'Z6Y JoogeLs a 0 0 D0EELS 1z Lonesitey pue aimjng
002'vL S2Z'9L 000'GL 0 0 [ 000'GL 0z SB0IAIBS [BIOG PUE LYIERH
1ar'zse S95'0EY Z.18'09F 0 0 2.8'00% Joos'ss 6l SHIOM, DlaNd
014'659 £16'E69 Y6 0.9 0 0 o ¥¥6'0L9 8L Aejes aland
$6%0 Bujoueurd JeQ ' saunypusdxg
9S6'FaL'LL 089'8E5'6 G20'90Y'6 'yl 1] 0 g rLy'E Zrs'LlLa'e 510'028 £25'6£8'L Ll $834N0g JSUIQ Pue $8NUBASY €301,

0.8't8 lo 0 —w 0 lo 0 0 0 0 9l S9|ES J855Y [&dED 10 Sp8DOI]

LZE'ZI8'D 0 0 Io lo 0 0 I ] gl 1954 Jo spasdalg
vLE'e0Z'e 000,252 8LZ'V15'C 147'652 0 Io LOB'ESL L 1] Io 000208 ¥l U saapsuel| (2jo1
'saunog Buidueul4 BYIO

S¥9'¥90'L 088'LL0'L LvLLEB'D §000°SSY' L 0 0 4199°199 Zr8'219'2 510'028 £2G6'2EE") €l senuaasy [eloL-qng
96.'/2€ 928'LiZ 000'LE o 0 0 0 0 |ooo’ie Zl Snoaue|[3IsIN
5l0°L 0 o Io [ 0 0 0 M Suswssessy [eeds
E87'889'L 000'c09' L 18R | | ! 0 o 0 0 L8162 oL S0IAISE 3 595 0} SARIBYD
| R |ods'a0s SL¥0LS Ic Io 0 0 S10'E0F 00V 201 [ [EBLLEATE T
¥00'ZS Jooz'op 00591 Io 0 0 0 0 0 005'9L 8 Apadaid pue AeUop Jo 957
BZL'10T Joog'ir 00£'00L | ] _ Io 002001 7 SIS § SasuUBo
969'655 |r29'ors 109'G.5 0 299'F [ooc*siry 0r6EsL 9 saxej Mo Jsu0
ZL8'68l' _oow.vmm_m Zrs'L19'e ChS'LLEZ S Senuasay dlL
0 _o 0 0 0 0 0 I saxe_| AJadoid Jusnbuyag

vEZ'180') 088°0FL' L 994°c62°) 0 000'269 0 991'9£9 £ Saxe ] ANBGoId AL 18N
1] 0] 4] 0 0 . o] 0 Z 183, Ana-saxe | Apadold pejoeoour) ssa
¥ee'L80'L 088°0FL'L 198Le62'L 0 000'259 0 991°9€9 I Auatiold uo pana sexe)
sonog Buiaueuld Jayip p sonuasay

()] [+ (r )] {H) {9) ) (E}] (a) (6] a) (9]
202 810z 6102 AMVY1IIMdONd| ININYNNEd [ SLO3roud FOIAMTS SANNIAIH SANNIAIY IVHANTD
IVNLOV  |a3lvinils3-3d| 13sang IVLIdYD l83aa WSS vI03dS
E [
Siea) |edsiq 6L0Z ‘0¢ IANNC A3AN3 YVIA
AUYVINANS 1394dng a3ldoay
juswabBeuely Jo juswpedsg >@—x= —l_ mo t—o

YZ'geq wiog



d oo Jozsews o g BO0'E2 w101 {zd dX3 U0 0/ 2urT + §§ 8ur)) 4IL3DANE LNIWAVd 20IANIS 1830 HONONI LON
p Jo NOMLOZTSS ON (o}
P P NOILOTTES ON e
0 I NOLLOFT3S ON 62
C Ip NOILDZT3S ON [t~
0 NGILDZES ON i
g g NOLLD3ES ON 2
P NOLLOF1IS ON (73]
o e NOLLO313S ON (ez)
T NOLLOZ T3S ON @ |
o NOLOTES ON iz}
[ o NOLLDTTS ON [z
d P NOILOTHS ON _a:
P I NOILOTTES ON 8
I _m NOILOTTES ON i)
0 0 NOLLOTHES ON 53]
0 p NOLLOZ13S ON s)
o o NOLLD3 T3S ON 1)
o o NOLLOTES ON feL)
P o NOLLOTTES ON 2
o 3 NOWDI TS ON b
[ g NOLLOITHS ON o)
) o NOILOTHS ON @
Ie 0 NOILOTES ON &
£7L908 L) 768 000'5¥5 E10ZI0EY0 ) 000°065% puog uogebiao [efeuag)
[T AT et T \_QSN WLz 05 0GEIEE PUBH UOHEBING RA%o0| (]
q (R Fig et 965L) o0'SZL 010k THOLIOE0 09 _Qo.oﬁ.m Puog UOREBIN0 oD [5)
0 \_mm,ms | EE T 006'5v2 LL0E/BZ/E0 35 __..s.mmm_o Puog UORBDIGT [RISURS) ]
0REEE C30¢E [TE3 0001 1t00 ) o 000005 PO JUBWIANDIGA] 1M 0D JHS[IE
0 _Mmﬁm P TF ) o00sL Ol CHaLTD 09-NON 005eh PUCE BUpUNeY JaMeg,
Is TR TEoL ) 00T [T} CHaLTD 05-NON 000505 PUOg BUEnysY enuene JEER|iL]
Bi= {rk= = (H)+ {2+ (2 (3) (a []] (a v
Aneaojueg Jqaq | sexe) sojues igeq 610Z 6102 6102 610Z Jaquny Joypny uoneBiigo anss
JEDA JUBLInG les ) jusung Aq8ng Adeng seag Adeng Adeng uonnjosey funogp 1920 i awep 1920
Pied junoury NVHL ¥3HLO spung | uopnebBiqo | juaby Bukeq I1saueju| led|sung igeq 0} payIUan joadA) unowy
wouy pied [Ej01 B8y puog ajeq
6102 Aajxny :BweN AN
TE3) RIS

Rweleusp o ueupekg

SLNIWAVd ISYHOUNG-3SYIT ‘SNVO'T ‘SONOS INNIAIY ‘SANOS 1L ‘SONOE NOLLVOITE0 WHINID
3INA3HOS 1930 WY3L DNOT

TOL ey




